
D.B.H Est. #

Bid 

Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class

1 6" - 12" 1282 No Bid No Bid $12.00 15,384.00$      $41.34 52,997.88$            No Bid No Bid $36.00 46,152.00$      

2 12.1"-20" 1577 No Bid No Bid $24.00 37,848.00$      $58.34 92,002.18$            No Bid No Bid $75.00 118,275.00$    

3 20.1"-30" 1098 No Bid No Bid $52.00 57,096.00$      $83.79 92,001.42$            No Bid No Bid $115.00 126,270.00$    

4 30.1" and Over 384 No Bid No Bid $85.00 32,640.00$      $85.94 33,000.96$            No Bid No Bid $180.00 69,120.00$      

-$                   142,968.00$    270,002.44$          -$                     359,817.00$    

1 man Log Loader

1 man Semi Tractor-trailer

Laborer $135.00

Village of Oak ParkVillage of Oak ParkVillage of Oak ParkVillage of Oak Park

2015 Cycle Pruning 2015 Cycle Pruning 2015 Cycle Pruning 2015 Cycle Pruning 

Nature's Trees Inc. (Autumn)Nature's Trees Inc. (Autumn)Nature's Trees Inc. (Autumn)Nature's Trees Inc. (Autumn)Davis Tree Care Inc.Davis Tree Care Inc.Davis Tree Care Inc.Davis Tree Care Inc. Winkler Tree Inc.Winkler Tree Inc.Winkler Tree Inc.Winkler Tree Inc.

$105.00 $125.00

$135.00

$280.00

$135.00

$280.00

$175.00

$175.00

$175.00

$270.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Emergency Call Out Rates Per HourEmergency Call Out Rates Per HourEmergency Call Out Rates Per HourEmergency Call Out Rates Per Hour

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$240.00

$700.00

$135.00

B. Haney & Sons Inc.B. Haney & Sons Inc.B. Haney & Sons Inc.B. Haney & Sons Inc.

2 men Chipper truck w/chipper

1 man Aerial Lift Truck

Total:Total:Total:Total:

Nels Johnson Tree ExpertsNels Johnson Tree ExpertsNels Johnson Tree ExpertsNels Johnson Tree Experts

No Bid

No Bid$135.00


