
























CORPORATION FILE DETAIL REPORT

 File Number 60503605

 Entity Name DAVIS TREE CARE AND LANDSCAPE, INCORPORATED

 Status ACTIVE 

 Entity Type CORPORATION  Type of Corp DOMESTIC BCA

 Incorporation Date 
(Domestic)

05/19/1999  State ILLINOIS

 Agent Name ROBERT R DAVIS  Agent Change Date 04/29/2008

 Agent Street Address 7741 MONROE  President Name & Address ROBERT R DAVIS 7741 

MONROE FOREST PARK 

60130

 Agent City FOREST PARK  Secretary Name & Address

 Agent Zip 60130  Duration Date PERPETUAL

 Annual Report Filing 
Date

06/14/2016  For Year 2016

Return to the Search Screen Purchase Certificate of Good Standing

(One Certificate per Transaction)

BACK TO CYBERDRIVEILLINOIS.COM HOME PAGE
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D.B.H

Avg 

Dia Est. # Bid Price Total by class

Bid 

Price Total by class

Bid 

Price Total by class

Bid 

Price Total by class

Bid 

Price Total by class

1 0"-11" 9 30 $7.50 2,025.00$        No Bid No Bid $3.15 850.50$           No Bid No Bid

2 11.1"-18" 16 95 $7.50 11,400.00$      No Bid No Bid $7.15 10,868.00$      No Bid No Bid

3 18.1"-24" 21.5 112 $11.00 26,488.00$      No Bid No Bid $11.15 26,849.20$      No Bid No Bid

4 24.1"-30" 26.5 45 $13.00 15,502.50$      No Bid No Bid $13.15 15,681.38$      No Bid No Bid

5 30..1"-36" 32.5 13 $17.00 7,182.50$        No Bid No Bid $17.15 7,245.88$        No Bid No Bid

6 36.1"- 41 5 $16.00 3,280.00$        No Bid No Bid $17.15 3,515.75$        No Bid No Bid

65,878.00$      -$                  65,010.70$      -$                  -$                  

D.B.H

Avg 

Dia Est. # Bid Price Total by class

Bid 

Price Total by class

Bid 

Price Total by class

Bid 

Price Total by class

Bid 

Price Total by class

1 0"-11" 6 10 $7.50 450.00$           $7.65 459.00$           $2.50 150.00$           No Bid No Bid

2 11.1"-18" 15 60 $7.50 6,750.00$        $15.40 13,860.00$      $14.00 12,600.00$      No Bid No Bid

3 18.1"-24" 21 90 $11.00 20,790.00$      $23.85 45,076.50$      $21.00 39,690.00$      No Bid No Bid

4 24.1"-30" 27 90 $13.00 31,590.00$      $27.50 66,825.00$      $25.00 60,750.00$      No Bid No Bid

5 30..1"-36" 33 78 $17.00 43,758.00$      $34.00 87,516.00$      $31.00 79,794.00$      No Bid No Bid

6 36.1"- 41 45 $16.00 29,520.00$      $40.75 75,183.75$      $38.00 70,110.00$      No Bid No Bid

132,858.00$   288,920.25$   263,094.00$   -$                  -$                  

Disqualified

Disqualified

Disqualified

Disqualified

Disqualified

$262.00

$155.00

$155.00

$155.00

$118.00

$240.00

$135.00

$135.00

$135.00

$105.00

2 men Chipper truck w/chipper

1 man Aerial Lift Truck

1 man Log Loader

1 man Semi Tractor-trailer

Laborer

$130.00

$100.00

$100.00

$125.00

$25.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Nels Johnson TreeNels Johnson TreeNels Johnson TreeNels Johnson Tree

Nels Johnson TreeNels Johnson TreeNels Johnson TreeNels Johnson Tree

Village of Oak ParkVillage of Oak ParkVillage of Oak ParkVillage of Oak Park

2015 Winter Parkway Removals2015 Winter Parkway Removals2015 Winter Parkway Removals2015 Winter Parkway Removals

Total:Total:Total:Total:

Total:Total:Total:Total:

A & B Tree Service Inc.A & B Tree Service Inc.A & B Tree Service Inc.A & B Tree Service Inc. B. Haney & Sons Inc.B. Haney & Sons Inc.B. Haney & Sons Inc.B. Haney & Sons Inc. Davis Tree Care Inc.Davis Tree Care Inc.Davis Tree Care Inc.Davis Tree Care Inc. Lucas LandscapingLucas LandscapingLucas LandscapingLucas Landscaping

Disqualified

Disqualified

B. Haney & Sons Inc.B. Haney & Sons Inc.B. Haney & Sons Inc.B. Haney & Sons Inc. Davis Tree Care Inc.Davis Tree Care Inc.Davis Tree Care Inc.Davis Tree Care Inc. Lucas LandscapingLucas LandscapingLucas LandscapingLucas LandscapingA & B Tree Service Inc.A & B Tree Service Inc.A & B Tree Service Inc.A & B Tree Service Inc.

Disqualified

Disqualified

Disqualified

Disqualified

Disqualified

2015 Summer Parkway Removals2015 Summer Parkway Removals2015 Summer Parkway Removals2015 Summer Parkway Removals

Emergency Call Out Rates Per HourEmergency Call Out Rates Per HourEmergency Call Out Rates Per HourEmergency Call Out Rates Per Hour

Disqualified

Disqualified

Disqualified

Disqualified

Disqualified
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