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1 North Ave. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $150.00 $150.00 $47.03 $676.24 $1,513.00 $487.00 $170.00 $3,360.00 $6,658.26 $806.14 $694.76 $13,022.48
2 Chicago Ave. East No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,031.14 $89.78 $211.09 $2,809.64 $2,068.00 $726.00 $341.00 $5,522.00 $6,658.26 $806.14 $694.76 $13,022.48
3 Chicago Ave. West No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $297.00 $27.68 $65.08 $845.32 $258.00 $90.00 $40.00 $668.00 $6,658.26 $806.14 $694.76 $13,022.48
4 Lake St. East No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,734.57 $150.95 $354.92 $4,724.88 $2,900.00 $786.00 $341.00 $6,414.00 $6,658.26 $806.14 $694.76 $13,022.48
5 Hemingway District No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $241.24 $21.40 $50.31 $665.12 $2,561.00 $574.00 $284.00 $5,407.00 $6,658.26 $806.14 $694.76 $13,022.48
6 South Marion No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $963.38 $83.50 $196.32 $2,617.44 $715.00 $181.00 $170.00 $2,256.00 $6,658.26 $806.14 $694.76 $13,022.48
7 Madison St. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,299.86 $810.09 $1,904.73 $25,347.79 $6,410.00 $2,190.00 $682.00 $14,056.00 $6,658.26 $806.14 $694.76 $13,022.48
8 Arts District No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,229.49 $282.59 $664.44 $8,827.60 $2,823.00 $967.00 $455.00 $7,430.00 $6,658.26 $806.14 $694.76 $13,022.48
9 South Town No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $399.98 $34.89 $82.03 $1,091.11 $715.00 $181.00 $170.00 $2,256.00 $6,658.26 $806.14 $694.76 $13,022.48

10 Roosevelt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $843.11 $73.26 $172.26 $2,294.45 $1,513.00 $487.00 $170.00 $3,360.00 $6,658.26 $806.14 $694.76 $13,022.48
11 Downtown Oak Park No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,890.73 $425.86 $1,001.31 $13,327.07 $3,578.00 $1,209.00 $455.00 $8,427.00 $6,658.26 $806.14 $694.76 $13,022.48

Total for Year: No Bid No Bid $63,226.66 $59,156.00 $143,247.28

Village of Oak Park
2017 Business District Landscape Maintenance Bid Summary

A & B Landscaping Inc. Christy Webber Landscapes City Escape Garden and Design McAdam Landscape Alvarez
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