
Corporation/LLC Search/Certificate of Good Standing

LLC File Detail Report

Entity Information

Agent Information

cyberdriveillinois.com is now ilsos.gov

Office of the Secretary of State Jesse White 

File Number 00865842

Entity Name CITYESCAPE GARDEN & DESIGN LLC

Status ACTIVE

Principal Office
3022 W LAKE ST
CHICAGO, IL 60612

Entity Type
LLC

Type of LLC
Domestic

Organization/Admission Date
Thursday, 20 February 2003

Jurisdiction
IL

Duration
Monday, 31 December 2029



Annual Report

Managers

Series Name

Name
BARRY C. KESSLER

Address
1275 MILWAUKEE AVE STE 300
GLENVIEW , IL 60025

Change Date
Thursday, 31 January 2013

For Year
2023

Filing Date
00/00/0000

Name
Address
RIVERA, CONNIE L
219 E LAKE SHORE DRIVE #11AB
CHICAGO, IL 60611

NOT AUTHORIZED TO ESTABLISH SERIES

Return to Search 

File Annual Report

Adopting Assumed Name
Articles of Amendment Effecting A Name Change

Change of Registered Agent and/or Registered O�ce

https://apps.ilsos.gov/corporatellc/


Mon Dec 19 2022This information was printed from www.ilsos.gov, the official website of the Illinois Secretary of State's Office.

(One Certificate per Transaction)



Business District
Spring Clean 

Up
Fall Clean 

Up
Total per 

Month Total per Year
Spring Clean 

Up
Fall Clean 

Up
Total per 

Month Total per Year
Spring Clean 

Up
Fall Clean 

Up
Total per 

Month Total per Year
Spring 

Clean Up
Fall Clean 

Up
Total per 

Month
Total per 

Year
Spring Clean 

Up
Fall Clean 

Up
Total per 

Month Total per Year
Spring Clean 

Up
Fall Clean 

Up
Total per 

Month Total per Year
1 North Ave. $745.00 $585.00 $200.00 $2,930.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $400.00 $198.00 $130.00 $1,638.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $196.00 $122.00 $167.00 $1,654.00
2 Chicago Ave. East $1,712.50 $567.00 $648.00 $7,463.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,412.00 $697.00 $458.00 $5,773.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,290.00 $648.00 $500.00 $5,938.00
3 Chicago Ave. West $419.00 $162.00 $200.00 $2,181.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $219.00 $108.00 $71.00 $895.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $297.00 $186.00 $58.00 $947.00
4 Lake St. East $1,996.00 $567.00 $405.00 $5,803.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,488.00 $734.00 $483.00 $6,086.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,430.00 $852.00 $500.00 $6,282.00
5 Hemingway District $563.00 $563.00 $405.00 $4,366.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $978.00 $483.00 $318.00 $4,005.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $345.00 $397.00 $418.00 $4,086.00
6 South Marion $800.00 $302.00 $200.00 $2,702.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $772.00 $381.00 $251.00 $3,161.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $818.00 $447.00 $249.00 $3,257.00
7 Madison St. $3,263.00 $702.00 $972.00 $11,741.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,744.00 $861.00 $566.00 $7,133.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,448.00 $846.00 $500.00 $7,294.00
8 Arts District $2,117.00 $936.00 $648.00 $8,237.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,104.00 $1,039.00 $683.00 $8,607.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,144.00 $1,167.00 $668.00 $8,655.00
9 South Town $486.00 $324.00 $200.00 $2,410.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $437.00 $216.00 $142.00 $1,789.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $298.00 $190.00 $167.00 $1,824.00

10 Roosevelt $1,262.00 $500.00 $200.00 $3,362.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $817.00 $403.00 $265.00 $3,340.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $944.00 $508.00 $250.00 $3,452.00
11 Downtown Oak Park $4,012.00 $1,206.00 $972.00 $12,994.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,440.00 $1,205.00 $792.00 $9,981.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,728.00 $1,234.00 $665.00 $10,282.00

Total for Year: $64,189.50 No Bid $52,408.00 No Bid No Bid $53,671.00

Village of Oak Park
2023 Business District Landscape Maintenance Bid Summary

Landscape Concepts McAdam LandscapeAlvarez City Escape Garden and Design Cleanslate ChicagoDiaz Landscape



Maintenance Type
Estimated 

Area (sq. yd.)

Bid Price      
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

Bid Price      
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

Bid Price      
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

Bid Price      
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

Bid Price      
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

Bid Price      
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

1 Turf Area 49,324.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.11 $5,259.87 $42,078.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Planter Bed Area 16,379.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.20 $3,428.40 $27,427.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 No Bid No Bid $14,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 No Bid No Bid $5,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid $88,906.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Village of Oak Park
2023 Regular Landscape Maintenance Bid Summary

Landscape Concepts

Total for year:

McAdam Landscape

Total for year:Total for year: Total for year: Total for year:

Cleanslate ChicagoAlvarez, Inc.

Total for year:

Diaz Landscape City Escape

Spring Clean-up
Fall Clean-up
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