A & B Tree Service Inc.

Village of Oak Park
2018 Parkway Tree Cycle Pruning

Davis Tree Care Inc.

Kramer Tree Experts Inc.

The Care of Tree Inc.

Winkler Tree Inc.

No D.B.H Est. # Urut Total by class Ur'1|t Total by class Urut Total by class Ur'1|t Total by class Urut Total by class
Price Price Price Price Price
1 6"-12" 1213 No Bid No Bid $25.00 | S 30,325.00 | No Bid No Bid $71.76 | S 87,044.88 | $35.00 | $ 42,455.00
2 12.1"-20" 1415 No Bid No Bid $48.00 | S 67,920.00 | No Bid No Bid $95.25 | $ 134,778.75] $79.00 | $ 111,785.00
3 20.1"-30" 777 No Bid No Bid $75.00 | S 58,275.00 | No Bid No Bid $144.56 S 112,323.12 | $124.00 $ 96,348.00
4 | 30.1" and Over 226 No Bid No Bid $95.00 $ 21,470.00 | No Bid No Bid $372.74| S 84,239.24 | $148.00| $ 33,448.00
Total: 177,990.00 $ 418,385.99 S 284,036.00
2018 Cycle Prumng Emergency Call Out Rates Per Hour

2 men Chipper truck w/chipper No Bid $240.00 No Bid $190.00 $250.00

1 man Aerial Lift Truck No Bid $135.00 No Bid $95.00 $175.00

1 man Log Loader No Bid $135.00 No Bid $125.00 $150.00

1 man Semi Tractor-trailer| No Bid $135.00 No Bid $190.00 $175.00

Laborer

A & B Tree Service Inc.

No Bid

$105.00

2018 Winter Parkway Tree Removals

Davis Tree Care Inc.

No Bid

Kramer Tree Experts Inc.

$95.00

The Care of Tree Inc.

$100.00

Winkler Tree Inc.

A & B Tree Service Inc.

2018 Parkway Tree Stu
Davis Tree Care Inc.

mp Removals
Kramer Tree Experts Inc.

The Care of Tree Inc.

No D.B.H AD\S Est. #|Bid Price, Total by class |Bid Price| Total by class |Bid Price| Total by class |Bid Price Total by class |Bid Price| Total by class
1 0"-11" 9 20 $3.00 | S 540.00 | $4.00 | $ 720.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 11.1"-18" 16 60 $7.50 | $ 7,200.00 | $8.00 S 7,680.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 18.1"-24" 215| 65 | $11.00 | $ 1537250 $13.00 | $  18,167.50 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 24.1"-30" 26.5| 40 | $13.00 | $ 13,780.00 | $15.00 | $  15,900.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 30.1"-36" 325| 10 | $17.00 S 5,525.00 | $18.00 | $ 5,850.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 36.1"- 41 | 10 | $17.00 S 6,970.00 | $20.00  $ 8,200.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total: S 49,387.50 $  56,517.50 $ - $ - $ -
2018 Summer Parkway Tree Removals
A & B Tree Service Inc. Davis Tree Care Inc. Kramer Tree Experts Inc. The Care of Tree Inc. Winkler Tree Inc.

No. D.B.H AD\S Est. #|Bid Price| Total by class |Bid Price| Total by class |Bid Price| Total by class |Bid Price| Total by class |Bid Price| Total by class
1 0"-11" 9 20 $7.50 | $ 1,350.00 | $2.50 | $ 450.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 11.1"-18" 16 | 30 | $11.50 | $ 5,520.00 | $14.00 | S 6,720.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 18.1"-24" 21 | 65 | $19.50 $  26,617.50 | $21.00 | $  28,665.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 24.1"-30" 27 | 55 | $23.00 $ 34,155.00 | $25.00 | $  37,125.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 30.1"-36" 33 | 60 | $28.50 $ 56,430.00 | $29.00 | $  57,420.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 36.1"- 41 | 40 | $35.00 $ 57,400.00 | $37.00 | $  60,680.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total: $ 181,472.50 $ 191,060.00 S - $ - $ -
2018 Parkway Tree Removal Emergency Call Out Rates Per Hour
2 men Chipper truck w/chipper $180.00 $240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 man Aerial Lift Truck $120.00 $135.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 man Log Loader $120.00 $135.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 man Semi Tractor-trailer| $120.00 $135.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Laborer $50.00 $105.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Winkler Tree Inc.

No Grind Type Est. # Bid Price Total Bid Price Total Bid Price Total Bid Price Total Bid Price Total
1 Full Grind 650 $246.00( $ 159,900.00 | $325.00( $ 211,250.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2018 Parkway Restoration Rate per Square Yard
Parkway Restoration with Sod $10.00 $350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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