
Plant Category Pot Size Plant Examples Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Summer Thriller 1 gal Colocasia, Cordyline, Gaura 227 No Bid No Bid $15.00 $3,405.00 $8.50 $1,929.50 $19.71 $4,474.17 No Bid No Bid
Summer Thriller 6" pot Colocasia, Cordyline, Gaura 243 No Bid No Bid $15.00 $3,645.00 $3.45 $838.35 $17.09 $4,152.87 No Bid No Bid
Summer Filler 1 gal Coleus, Geranium, Lantana 93 No Bid No Bid $11.22 $1,043.46 $4.50 $418.50 $12.29 $1,142.97 No Bid No Bid
Summer Filler 6" pot Coleus, Geranium, Lantana 243 No Bid No Bid $11.22 $2,726.46 $3.45 $838.35 $8.60 $2,089.80 No Bid No Bid
Summer Filler 4" pot Coleus, Geranium, Lantana 1,088 No Bid No Bid $4.89 $5,320.32 $2.78 $3,024.64 $4.75 $5,168.00 No Bid No Bid
Summer Spiller 1 gal Ipomoea, Petunia, Stachys 13 No Bid No Bid $11.22 $145.86 $4.50 $58.50 $11.16 $145.08 No Bid No Bid
Summer Spiller 6" pot Ipomoea, Petunia, Stachys 42 No Bid No Bid $11.22 $471.24 $3.45 $144.90 $8.60 $361.20 No Bid No Bid
Summer Spiller 4" pot Ipomoea, Petunia, Stachys 2,532 No Bid No Bid $4.89 $12,381.48 $2.78 $7,038.96 $4.75 $12,027.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid $29,138.00 $14,291.70 $29,561.09 No Bid

Plant Category Pot Size Plant Examples Quantity
Fall Thriller 1 gal Kale, Pennisetum 184 No Bid No Bid $12.24 $2,252.16 $5.35 $984.40 $10.64 $1,957.76 No Bid No Bid
Fall Filler 3 gal Brassica, Chrysanthemum 35 No Bid No Bid $22.95 $803.25 $10.00 $350.00 $35.00 $1,225.00 No Bid No Bid
Fall Filler 8" pot Brassica, Chrysanthemum 545 No Bid No Bid $8.67 $4,725.15 $3.75 $2,043.75 $10.26 $5,591.70 No Bid No Bid
Fall Filler 6" pot Brassica, Chrysanthemum 225 No Bid No Bid $8.67 $1,950.75 $3.00 $675.00 $9.51 $2,139.75 No Bid No Bid
Fall Spiller 4" pot Viola 1,120 No Bid No Bid $4.38 $4,905.60 $1.88 $2,105.60 $2.21 $2,475.20 No Bid No Bid

No Bid $14,635.00 $6,158.75 $13,389.41 No Bid

Plant Category Pot Size Plant Examples Quantity
Summer Thriller 1 gal Colocasia, Cordyline, Gaura 82 No Bid No Bid $15.00 $1,230.00 $8.50 $697.00 $19.71 $1,616.22 No Bid No Bid
Summer Thriller 6" pot Colocasia, Cordyline, Gaura 87 No Bid No Bid $15.00 $1,305.00 $3.45 $300.15 $17.09 $1,486.83 No Bid No Bid
Summer Filler 4” pot Coleus, Geranium, Lantana 33 No Bid No Bid $4.89 $161.37 $2.78 $91.74 $12.29 $405.57 No Bid No Bid
Summer Filler 6" pot Coleus, Geranium, Lantana 87 No Bid No Bid $11.22 $976.14 $3.45 $300.15 $8.60 $748.20 No Bid No Bid
Summer Filler 4" pot Coleus, Geranium, Lantana 391 No Bid No Bid $4.89 $1,911.99 $2.78 $1,086.98 $4.75 $1,857.25 No Bid No Bid
Summer Spiller 1 gal Ipomoea, Petunia, Stachys 5 No Bid No Bid $11.22 $56.10 $4.50 $22.50 $11.16 $55.80 No Bid No Bid
Summer Spiller 6" pot Ipomoea, Petunia, Stachys 15 No Bid No Bid $11.22 $168.30 $3.45 $51.75 $8.60 $129.00 No Bid No Bid
Summer Spiller 4" pot Ipomoea, Petunia, Stachys 910 No Bid No Bid $4.89 $4,449.90 $2.78 $2,529.80 $4.75 $4,322.50 No Bid No Bid

No Bid $10,257.00 $5,080.07 $10,621.37 No Bid

Plant Category Pot Size Plant Examples Quantity
Fall Thriller 1 gal Kale, Pennisetum 51 No Bid No Bid $12.24 $624.24 $5.35 $272.85 $10.64 $542.64 No Bid No Bid
Fall Filler 3 gal Brassica, Chrysanthemum 10 No Bid No Bid $22.95 $229.50 $10.00 $100.00 $35.00 $350.00 No Bid No Bid
Fall Filler 8" pot Brassica, Chrysanthemum 150 No Bid No Bid $8.67 $1,300.50 $3.75 $562.50 $10.26 $1,539.00 No Bid No Bid
Fall Filler 6" pot Brassica, Chrysanthemum 62 No Bid No Bid $8.67 $537.54 $3.00 $186.00 $9.51 $589.62 No Bid No Bid
Fall Spiller 4" pot Viola 309 No Bid No Bid $4.39 $1,356.51 $1.88 $580.92 $2.21 $682.89 No Bid No Bid

No Bid $4,043.00 $1,702.27 $3,704.15 No Bid

No Bid $58,073.00 $27,232.79 $57,276.02 No Bid
No Bid $43,773.00 $1,400.00 $788.00 No Bid
No Bid $14,300.00 $280.00 $338.00 No Bid
No Bid $65.00 $38.00 $45.00 No Bid

No Bid $161,646.00 $67,272.79 $97,784.02 No Bid

Total VOP Areas Maintenance per Month:
Total DTOP Areas Maintenance per Month:

Watering per Hour:

Total Cost for 2017:

2017 Fall Rotation: DTOP

2017 Summer Rotation: VOP Areas 

2017 Fall Rotation: VOP Areas

2017 Summer Rotation: DTOP 

Total Rotations Cost:

Total Fall Rotation Cost:

Total Summer Rotation Cost:

Total Fall Rotation Cost:

Total Summer Rotation Cost:

McAdam Landscape Alvarez

Village of Oak Park
2017 Container Planting Installation and Maintenance Bid Summary

A & B Landscaping Inc. Christy Webber Landscapes City Escape
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