
RES 18-802_K_030518

RENEWAL OF AN INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR AGREEMENT BETWEEN
THE VILLAGE OF OAK PARK AND CITYESCAPE GARDEN & DESIGN, LCC

FOR THE 2018 VILLAGE CONTAINER PLANTINGS PROGRAM
IN AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $70,000.00

THIS RENEWAL OF THE INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR AGREEMENT (hereinafter
“Renewal”) between the Village of Oak Park, an Illinois home rule municipal corporation
(hereinafter the “Village”), and CityEscape Garden & Design LLC (hereinafter the “Contractor”),
an Illinois Limited Liability Company, is entered into as of the effective date set forth
below (collectively referred to as the “Parties”).

RECITALS

WHEREAS, the Parties previously entered into an Independent Contractor Agreement
dated February 23, 2017 (“Agreement”); and

WHEREAS, the Parties seek to renew the Agreement pursuant to the terms of the
Agreement in an amount not to exceed $70,000.00.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the foregoing, and the mutual covenants and
agreements contained herein and other good and valuable consideration, the receipt and
sufficiency of which is acknowledged by the Parties, the Parties hereto agree as follows:

1. RECITALS INCORPORATED. The above recitals are incorporated herein as
though fully set forth.

2. RENEWAL OF AGREEMENT. The Agreement between the Parties is hereby
renewed pursuant to the terms of the Agreement from the date of execution of this renewal
through December 31, 2018.

3. OTHER PROVISIONS OF THE AGREEMENT TO REMAIN IN EFFECT. All other
terms and conditions of the Agreement shall remain in full force and effect.

4. EFFECTIVE DATE. This Renewal shall be effective on the date of it5 execution
by the Village Manager of the Village of Oak Park.

[REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK —

SIGNATURE PAGE FOLLOWSj



IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused this Renewal to be signed by their
duly authorized representatives on the dates set forth below.

By: Cara Pavlicek
Its: Village Manager

By: Vicki Scaman
Its: Village Clerk

CITYESCAPE GARDEN & DESIGN LLC

By: Cor’ h ;. AjV-cjct._
Its: Than&fi’ Th6nifr&z_

Dated: /i’t- /èm 2018

ATTEST

-St’: ,P-tb-c-c-c G. O,ea7..
Its: c.,4., “2r

VILLAGE OF OAK PARK

Dated:

ATTEST

,2018

Dated: ,2018 Dated: , 2018
/
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• Village of Oak Park
sww.oak-park.us

Oak Park
Agenda Item Summary

FiIe#: RES 18-802, Version: 1

Submitted By
John P. Wielebnicki, Director of Public Works

Reviewed By
LKS

Agenda Item Title
A Resolution Approving the Renewal of the Independent Contractor Agreement with CityEscape Garden &
Design LLC for the 2018 Village Container Plantings Program in an Amount not to Exceed $70,000.00 and
Authorizing Its Execution

Overview
In January of 2017 Village staff requested bids for three separate landscaping contracts under a
“Comprehensive Landscaping Bid”. City Escape Garden & Design LLC, of Chicago, IL was identified as low
responsive bidder for one of the contracts, the Village Container Plantings Program. The Village entered into
an Independent Contractor Agreement with City Escape in 2017 and it is proposed to exercise the first of the
two possible renewals.

Staff Recommendation
Approve the Resolution.

Fiscal Impact
For this work, the F’? 2018 budget provides a total of $160,000.00 for 1) the installation of plants and their
maintenance in above ground movable container landscape planters and 2) Business District landscape
maintenance in the General Fund, General Contractuals account no. 1001-43800-742-530660.

This item is for the installation of plants and their maintenance in above ground movable planters which is
proposed at a not to exceed amount of $70,000.00 from the above budget line item.

The second item noted in the first paragraph, Business District landscape maintenance, will be presented
under another Board Agenda item. This amount also does not include landscape maintenance in DTOP which
will be handled under an agreement with DIOP for that maintenance with funds also coming from the above
budget line item.

Background
The Village maintains the landscaping in multiple business districts across the Village. Village staff, business
owners, and residents place high importance on the quality and cleanliness of their business districts. Part of
providing a high quality unified streetscape design across the village is the installation and maintenance of
plant material in approximately 435 above ground movable container landscape planters.
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City Escape Garden & Design LLC was the low responsive bidder for this contract when the work was bid out in
late 2016 for FY 2017. They have completed this type of work for the Village in the past including in 2017.
They are a quality contractor who provides excellent service. Village staff is requesting to exercise the first of
the two possible renewals outlined in the original contract.

The Container Plantings program work begins in May with a cleanup and installation of perennial and annual
planting materials in 435 containers across the multiple business districts. The containers are visited every
couple days as necessary to water the plants and maintain the containers. There is a second installation that
occurs in the fall with material more appropriate to the season. Those plants are watered and maintained
through December.

The following is the proposed contract amount for this project:

- Base Installation and Maintenance: $32,000.00
- Estimated 600 Hours of watering at $38.00 per hour: $23,000.00
- Plant additions, replacements, extra watering or other required work: $15,000.00

Total not to exceed amount for this contract is proposed to be $70,000.00

Alternatives
The Board can delay action to gain additional information.

Previous Board Action
The Village Board has approved the contract annually and in 2017 City Escape was approved for the first year
of the contract.

Citizen Advisory Commission Action
N/A.

Anticipated Future Actions/Commitments
It is anticipated that the Department of Public Works will be bringing this agreement to the Village Board
annually.

Intergovernmental Cooperation Opportunities
None at this time.

Performance Management (MAP) Alignment
This work is in alignment with the Governance Priority established for the Department of Public Works for
Maintenance and Service Programs.
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RESOLUTION

A RESOLUTION APPROVING THE RENEWAL OF THE INDEPENDENT
CONTRACTOR AGREEMENT WITH CITVESCAPE GARDEN & DESIGN LLC

FOR THE 2018 VILLAGE CONTAINER PLANTINGS PROGRAM IN AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED
$70,000.00 AND AUTHORIZING ITS EXECUTION

BE IT RESOLVED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village of Oak Park, Cook

County, State of Illinois (“Village”), in the exercise of their home rule powers, that the Renewal

of the Independent Contractor Agreement (“Renewal”) with CityEscape Garden & Design LLC of

Chicago, Illinois, for fiscal year 2018 Village container plantings is renewed pursuant to the

terms of the Agreement in an amount not to exceed $70,000.00 and the Village Manager is

authorized to execute the Renewal in substantially the form attached.

THIS RESOLUTION shall be in full force and effect from and after its adoption and

approval as provided by law.

ADOPTED this 5Zh day of March, 2018, pursuant to a roll call vote as follows:

Voting Aye Nay Abstain Absent
President Abu-Taleb .7
Trustee And rews /
Trustee Boutet
Trustee Button
Trustee Moroney /
Trustee Taglia /
Trustee Tucker /

APPROVED this 5th day of March,

/

1
f Anan Abu-Taleb, Village President

ATtEST

Vicki Scaman, Village Clerk



Plant Category Pot Size Plant Examples Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Summer Thriller 1 gal Colocasia, Cordyline, Gaura 227 No Bid No Bid $15.00 $3,405.00 $8.50 $1,929.50 $19.71 $4,474.17 No Bid No Bid
Summer Thriller 6" pot Colocasia, Cordyline, Gaura 243 No Bid No Bid $15.00 $3,645.00 $3.45 $838.35 $17.09 $4,152.87 No Bid No Bid
Summer Filler 1 gal Coleus, Geranium, Lantana 93 No Bid No Bid $11.22 $1,043.46 $4.50 $418.50 $12.29 $1,142.97 No Bid No Bid
Summer Filler 6" pot Coleus, Geranium, Lantana 243 No Bid No Bid $11.22 $2,726.46 $3.45 $838.35 $8.60 $2,089.80 No Bid No Bid
Summer Filler 4" pot Coleus, Geranium, Lantana 1,088 No Bid No Bid $4.89 $5,320.32 $2.78 $3,024.64 $4.75 $5,168.00 No Bid No Bid
Summer Spiller 1 gal Ipomoea, Petunia, Stachys 13 No Bid No Bid $11.22 $145.86 $4.50 $58.50 $11.16 $145.08 No Bid No Bid
Summer Spiller 6" pot Ipomoea, Petunia, Stachys 42 No Bid No Bid $11.22 $471.24 $3.45 $144.90 $8.60 $361.20 No Bid No Bid
Summer Spiller 4" pot Ipomoea, Petunia, Stachys 2,532 No Bid No Bid $4.89 $12,381.48 $2.78 $7,038.96 $4.75 $12,027.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid $29,138.00 $14,291.70 $29,561.09 No Bid

Plant Category Pot Size Plant Examples Quantity
Fall Thriller 1 gal Kale, Pennisetum 184 No Bid No Bid $12.24 $2,252.16 $5.35 $984.40 $10.64 $1,957.76 No Bid No Bid
Fall Filler 3 gal Brassica, Chrysanthemum 35 No Bid No Bid $22.95 $803.25 $10.00 $350.00 $35.00 $1,225.00 No Bid No Bid
Fall Filler 8" pot Brassica, Chrysanthemum 545 No Bid No Bid $8.67 $4,725.15 $3.75 $2,043.75 $10.26 $5,591.70 No Bid No Bid
Fall Filler 6" pot Brassica, Chrysanthemum 225 No Bid No Bid $8.67 $1,950.75 $3.00 $675.00 $9.51 $2,139.75 No Bid No Bid
Fall Spiller 4" pot Viola 1,120 No Bid No Bid $4.38 $4,905.60 $1.88 $2,105.60 $2.21 $2,475.20 No Bid No Bid

No Bid $14,635.00 $6,158.75 $13,389.41 No Bid

Plant Category Pot Size Plant Examples Quantity
Summer Thriller 1 gal Colocasia, Cordyline, Gaura 82 No Bid No Bid $15.00 $1,230.00 $8.50 $697.00 $19.71 $1,616.22 No Bid No Bid
Summer Thriller 6" pot Colocasia, Cordyline, Gaura 87 No Bid No Bid $15.00 $1,305.00 $3.45 $300.15 $17.09 $1,486.83 No Bid No Bid
Summer Filler 4” pot Coleus, Geranium, Lantana 33 No Bid No Bid $4.89 $161.37 $2.78 $91.74 $12.29 $405.57 No Bid No Bid
Summer Filler 6" pot Coleus, Geranium, Lantana 87 No Bid No Bid $11.22 $976.14 $3.45 $300.15 $8.60 $748.20 No Bid No Bid
Summer Filler 4" pot Coleus, Geranium, Lantana 391 No Bid No Bid $4.89 $1,911.99 $2.78 $1,086.98 $4.75 $1,857.25 No Bid No Bid
Summer Spiller 1 gal Ipomoea, Petunia, Stachys 5 No Bid No Bid $11.22 $56.10 $4.50 $22.50 $11.16 $55.80 No Bid No Bid
Summer Spiller 6" pot Ipomoea, Petunia, Stachys 15 No Bid No Bid $11.22 $168.30 $3.45 $51.75 $8.60 $129.00 No Bid No Bid
Summer Spiller 4" pot Ipomoea, Petunia, Stachys 910 No Bid No Bid $4.89 $4,449.90 $2.78 $2,529.80 $4.75 $4,322.50 No Bid No Bid

No Bid $10,257.00 $5,080.07 $10,621.37 No Bid

Plant Category Pot Size Plant Examples Quantity
Fall Thriller 1 gal Kale, Pennisetum 51 No Bid No Bid $12.24 $624.24 $5.35 $272.85 $10.64 $542.64 No Bid No Bid
Fall Filler 3 gal Brassica, Chrysanthemum 10 No Bid No Bid $22.95 $229.50 $10.00 $100.00 $35.00 $350.00 No Bid No Bid
Fall Filler 8" pot Brassica, Chrysanthemum 150 No Bid No Bid $8.67 $1,300.50 $3.75 $562.50 $10.26 $1,539.00 No Bid No Bid
Fall Filler 6" pot Brassica, Chrysanthemum 62 No Bid No Bid $8.67 $537.54 $3.00 $186.00 $9.51 $589.62 No Bid No Bid
Fall Spiller 4" pot Viola 309 No Bid No Bid $4.39 $1,356.51 $1.88 $580.92 $2.21 $682.89 No Bid No Bid

No Bid $4,043.00 $1,702.27 $3,704.15 No Bid

No Bid $58,073.00 $27,232.79 $57,276.02 No Bid
No Bid $43,773.00 $1,400.00 $788.00 No Bid
No Bid $14,300.00 $280.00 $338.00 No Bid
No Bid $65.00 $38.00 $45.00 No Bid

No Bid $161,646.00 $67,272.79 $97,784.02 No Bid

Total VOP Areas Maintenance per Month:
Total DTOP Areas Maintenance per Month:

Watering per Hour:

Total Cost for 2017:

2017 Fall Rotation: DTOP

2017 Summer Rotation: VOP Areas 

2017 Fall Rotation: VOP Areas

2017 Summer Rotation: DTOP 

Total Rotations Cost:

Total Fall Rotation Cost:

Total Summer Rotation Cost:

Total Fall Rotation Cost:

Total Summer Rotation Cost:

McAdam Landscape Alvarez

Village of Oak Park
2017 Container Planting Installation and Maintenance Bid Summary

A & B Landscaping Inc. Christy Webber Landscapes City Escape
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