






















Maintenance Type
Estimated 

Area (sq. yd.)

Bid Price      
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

Bid Price      
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

Bid Price      
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

Bid Price      
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

Bid Price      
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

1 Turf Area 49,192.00 $0.10 $4,919.20 $39,353.60 $0.13 $6,394.96 $51,159.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.09 $4,181.32 $33,450.56 $0.16 $7,870.72 $62,965.76
2 Planter Bed Area 18,345.00 $0.29 $5,320.05 $42,560.40 $0.15 $2,751.75 $22,014.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.20 $3,669.00 $29,352.00 $0.11 $2,017.95 $16,143.60
3 $7,500.00 $78,210.17 No Bid $1,619.00 $77,200.00
4 $7,500.00 $8,867.52 No Bid $2,428.88 $8,200.00

$96,914.00 $160,251.37 No Bid $66,850.44 $164,509.36

Village of Oak Park
2017 Regular Landscape Maintenance Bid Summary

Total for year: Total for year: Total for year: Total for year:

McAdam LandscapeA & B Landscaping Inc. Alvarez, Inc. Christy Webber City Escape

Spring Clean-up
Fall Clean-up

Total for year:











































































































http://getfireshot.com/pdf_amF2YXNjcmlwdDp2aWV3bW1zKCk7
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http://getfireshot.com/pdf_aHR0cDovL3d3dy5jeWJlcmRyaXZlaWxsaW5vaXMuY29tL2hvbWUuaHRtbA==
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