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INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR AGREEMENT

THIS INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR AGREEMENT (“Contract”) is entered into on this

day of November, 2017, by and between the Village of Oak Park, an Illinois home rule
municipal corporation {hereinafter the “Village”), and Davis Tree Care and Landscape, Inc., an
Iinois Corporation (hereafter the “Contractor”).

WHEREAS, Contractor submitted a Proposal dated September 19, 2017, a copy of which is
attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference, to provide Parkway Tree Removal
(hereinafter referred to as the “Work”) for the Village Comprehensive Tree Maintenance Program
(hereinafter referred to as the “Project”) pursuant to the Village’s Request for Proposals dated
September 6, 2017, incorporated herein by reference as though fully set forth; and

WHEREAS, the Contractor represented in said Proposal that it has the necessary personnel,
experience, and competence to promptly complete the Project and the Work required hereunder
(hereinafter referred to as the "Work”}; and

WHEREAS, Contractor shall perform the Work pursuant to the terms and conditions of this
Contract.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the premises and the mutual promises contained in
this Contract, and other good and valuable consideration received and to be received, it is
mutually agreed by and between the parties as follows:

i, RECITALS INCORPORATED
The above recitals are incorporated herein as though fully set forth.
2. SCOPE OF WORK

Contractor shall perform the Work for the Project in accordance with its Proposal for a
price not to exceed $190,000.00 (“Contract Price”). Contractor shall complete the Work
in accordance with any applicable manufacturers’ warranties and in accordance with its
Proposal, the Village's Request for Proposals, and this Contract, all of which together
shall constitute the “Contract Documents.” The Contractor acknowledges that it has
inspected the site(s) where the Work is to be performed and that it is fully familiar with
all of the conditions at the site(s), and further that its Proposal has adequately taken
into consideration all of the conditions at the sites. The Contractor hereby represents
and warrants that it has the skill and experience necessary to complete the Work in a



good and workmanlike manner in accordance with the Contract Documents, and that
the Work shall be free from defects. Contractor shall achieve completion of all work
required pursuant to the Contract Documents by December 31st, 2018 (“Contract
Time”). The Contract Time is of the essence. In the event the Contractor fails to
complete the Work on or before said date, the Village shall be entitled to liquidated
damages in the amount of $500.00 per day for each day the Work remains uncompleted
beyond the completion date set forth above. This amount is not a penalty, and the
parties agree to said amount given the difficulties associated with determining or
calculating damages to the Village in the event the Work is not completed on time.
Contractor shall have no claim for damages, for compensation in excess of the Contract
Price, or for a delay or extension of the Contract Time based upon conditions found at,
or in the vicinity of, the site(s).

DESIGNATED REPRESENTATIVES

Contractor shall designate in writing a person to act as its designated representative
with respect to the Work to be performed under this Contract who shall have the power
and authority to make or grant or do all things, certificates, requests, demands,
approvals, consents, notices and other actions required that are ministerial in nature or
described in this Agreement for and on behalf of Contractor and with the effect of
binding Contractor. The Village is entitled to refy on the full power and authority of the
person executing this Contract on behalf of Contractor as having been properly and
legally given by Contractor. Contractor shall have the right to change its designated
representative by providing the Village with written notice of such change which notice
shall be sent in accordance with Section 12 of this Agreement.

The Village's Director of Public Works or the Director's designee shall be deemed the
Village's authorized representative for purposes of this Agreement, unless applicable
law requires action by the Corporate Authorities, and shall have the power and
authority to make or grant or do those things, certificates, requests, demands,
approvals, consents, notices and other actions required that are ministerial in nature or
described in this Agreement for and on behalf of the Village and with the effect of
binding the Village as limited by this Contract. Contractor is entitled to rely on the full
power and authority of the person executing this Agreement on behalf of the Village as
having been properly and legaliy given by the Village. The Village shall have the right to
change its authorized representative by providing Contractor with written notice of such
change which notice shall be sent in accordance with Section 12 of this Agreement.

TERM OF CONTRACT
Contractor shall perform the Work pursuant to this Contract beginning on the effective

date as defined herein and ending on December 31, 2018 or as determined by the
Village. The Contractor shall invoice the Village for the Work provided pursuant to this



Contract at the rates set forth in its Proposal. The term of this Contract may be extended
in writing for one additional period of one year pursuant to the consent of the parties.

PAYMENT SCHEDULE

Contractor shall, as a condition precedent to its right to receive any payment, submit to the
Village an application for payment and such receipts, vouchers, and other documents as
may be necessary to establish the Contractor's payment for all labor and material and the
absence of any interest whether in the nature of a lien or otherwise of any party in any
property, work, or fund with respect to the Work performed hereunder. Such documents
shall include, where relevant, the following forms, copies of which are attached hereto:

{i) Contractor's sworn statement;

(i) Contractor's partial or final waiver of lien;
(iii) Subcontractor's sworn statement(s); and

(v}  Subcontractor's partial or final waiver of lien.

Payment by the Village shall be conditioned upon an inspection by the Village of the
Work completed and submission of required waivers by the Contractor. Payment by the
Village shall in no way constitute a waiver of, or relieve the Contractor from, any defects
in the work. All payments shall be made in accordance with the lllinois Local
Government Prompt Payment Act, 50 ILCS 505/1 et seq. Final payment for any Work
performed by the Contractor pursuant to an invoice by Contractor shall be made by the
Village to the Contractor when Contractor has fully performed the work and the work
has been approved by the Village and submission of required waivers and paperwork by
Contractor. Approval of the work and issuance of the final payment by the Village shall
not constitute a waiver of, or release Contractor from, any defects in the work.

The Village shall have the right to withhold from any payment due hereunder such amount
as may reasonably appear necessary to compensate the Village for any actual or
prospective loss due to Work which is defective or does not conform to the Contract
Documents; damage for which Contractor is liable hereunder; liens or claims of liens;
claims of third parties, subcontractors, or material men; or any failure of the Contractor to
perform any of its obligations under this Contract. The Village may apply any money
withheld or due Contractor hereunder to reimburse itself for any and all costs, expenses,
losses, damages, liabilities, suits, judgments, awards, and attorney's fees incurred,
suffered, or sustained by the Village and chargeable to Contractor.

TERMINATION

The Village may terminate this Contract for cause, which includes but is not necessarily
limited to, the Contractor’s failure to perform the work pursuant to this Contract. The
Village shall provide the Contractor with five (5) days’ written notice of a termination for
cause pursuant to the provisions of Section 12 below. The Village may also terminate



this Contract when it determines the same to be in its best interests by giving fourteen
(14) days’ written notice to Contractor pursuant to the provisions of Section 12 below.
In such event, the Village shall pay to Contractor all amounts due for the work
performed up to the date of termination.

COMPLIANCE WITH APPLICABLE LAWS

Contractor shall comply with all applicable laws, regulations, and rules promulgated by
any federal, state, county, municipal and/or other governmental unit or regulatory body
now in effect during the performance of the Work. By way of example only and not as a
limitation, the following are included within the scope of the laws, regulations and rules
with which the Contractor must comply: all forms of workers’ compensation laws, all
terms of the equal employment opportunity rules and regulations of the Illinois
Department of Human Rights, statutes relating to contracts let by units of government,
and all applicable civil rights and anti-discrimination laws and regulations, including
those prohibiting discrimination because of, or requiring affirmative action based on
race, color, religion, sex, national origin, ancestry, age, order of protection status,
marital status, physical or mental disability, military status, sexual orientation, or
unfavorable discharge from military service or other prohibited classification, including,
without limitation, the Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990, 42 U.S.C. §§ 12101 et
seq., and the Illinois Human Rights Act, 775 ILCS 5/1-101 et seq. Contractor shall also
comply with Cook County’s minimum wage and sick leave ordinances, respectively Cook
County Ordinance Number 16-5768 and Cook County Ordinance Number 16-4229.

INDEMNIFICATION

To the fullest extent permitted by law, Contractor shall waive any right of contribution
against the Village and shall indemnify and hold harmless the Village and its officers,
officials, employees, volunteers and agents from and against all claims, damages, losses
and expenses, including, but not limited to, legal fees (attorney's and paralegal’s fees,
expert fees and court costs) arising out of or resulting from the performance of the
Contractor’s work, provided that any such claim, damage, loss or expense is attributable
to bodily injury, sickness, disease or death, or injury to or destruction of property, other
than the work itself, including the loss of use resulting therefrom, or is attributable to
misuse or improper use of trademark or copyright-protected material or otherwise
protected intellectual property, to the extent it is caused in whole or in part by any
wrongful or negligent act or omission of Contractor, any subcontractor, anyone directly
or indirectly employed by any of them or anyone for whose acts any of them may be
liable. Such obligation shall not be construed to negate, abridge or otherwise reduce
any other right to indemnity which the Village would otherwise have. Contractor shall
similarly protect, indemnify and hold and save harmless, the Village, its officers, officials,
employees, volunteers and agents against and from any and all claims, costs, causes,
actions and expenses, including, but not limited to, legal fees incurred by reason of the
Contractor’s breach of any of its obligations under, or Contractor's default of, any



provisions of this Contract. The indemnification obligations under this Section shall not
be limited in any way by any limitation on the amount or type of damages,
compensation, or benefits payable by or for the Contractor or any subcontractor under
Workers’ Compensation or Disability Benefit Acts or Employee Benefit Acts.

INSURANCE

Contractor shall at Contractor's expense secure and maintain in effect throughout the
duration of this Contract, insurance of the following kinds and limits set forth in this
Section. Contractor shall furnish “Certificates of Insurance” to the Village before
beginning work on the Project pursuant to this Contract. All insurance policies shall be
written with insurance companies licensed to do business in the State of lllinois and
having a rating of at least A according to the latest edition of the Best’s Key Rating
Guide; and shall include a provision preventing cancellation of the insurance policy
uniess thirty (30) days prior written notice is given to the Village. This provision shal!
also be stated on each Certificate of Insurance: "Should any of the above described
policies be canceled before the expiration date, the issuing company shall mail fifteen
thirty (30) days written notice to the certificate holder named to the left.”

The limits of liability for the insurance required shall provide coverage for not less than the
following amounts, or greater where required by law:

(A) Commercial General Liability:

i. Coverage to include Broad Form Property Damage, Contractual and
Personal Injury.

ii. Limits:
General Aggregate $ 2,000,000.00
Each Occurrence S 1,000,000.00
Personal Injury $ 1,000,000.00

iii. Coverage for all claims arising out of the Contractor's operations or
premises and anyone directly or indirectly employed by the Contractor.

(B} Workers' Compensation:

i Workers' compensation insurance shall be provided in accordance
with the provisions of the laws of the State of lllinois, including occupational
disease provisions, for all employees who perform the Work pursuant to
this Contract, and if work is subcontracted pursuant to the provisions of this
Contract, Contractor shall require each subcontractor similarly to provide
workers’ compensation insurance. In case employees engaged in
hazardous work under this Contract are not protected under the Workers’
Compensation Act, Contractor shall provide, and shall cause each
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subcontractor to provide, adequate and suitable insurance for the
protection of employees not otherwise provided.

(C) Comprehensive Automobile Liability:

i Comprehensive Automobile Liability coverage shall include all
owned, hired, non-owned vehicles, and/or trailers and other equipment
required to be licensed, covering personal injury, bodily injury and property
damage.

Ii. Limits:
Combined Single Limit $1,000,000.00

(D) Umbrella:

i Limits:
Each Occurrence/Aggregate
$5,000,000.00

(E) The Village, its officers, officials, employees, agents and volunteers shall
be named as additional insureds on all insurance policies set forth herein except Workers'
Compensation. The Contractor shall be responsible for the payment of any deductibles for
said insurance policies. The coverage shall contain no special limitations on the scope of
protection afforded to the Village, its officers, officials, employees, agents, and volunteers.

{F) Contractor understands and agrees that any insurance protection
required by this Contract or otherwise provided by Contractor, shall in no way limit the
responsibility to indemnify, keep and save harmless, and defend the Village, its officers,
officials, employees, agents and volunteers as herein provided. Contractor waives and
shall have its insurers waive, its rights of subrogation against the Village, its officers,
officials, employees, agents and volunteers.

GUARANTY

Contractor warrants and guarantees that its Work provided for the Project to be
performed under this Contract, and all workmanship, materials, equipment, and supplies
performed, furnished, used, or installed under this Contract, performed, furnished, used,
or installed under this Contract, shall be free from defects and flaws in workmanship or
design; shall strictly conform to the requirements of this Contract; and shall be fit and
sufficient for the purposes expressed in, or reasonably inferred from, this Contract.
Contractor further warrants and guarantees that the strength of all parts of all
manufactured materials, equipment, and supplies shall be adequate and as specified and
that the performance requirements of this Contract shall be fuffilled.
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Contractor shall, at no expense to the Village, correct any failure to fulfill the above
guaranty that may appear at any time. In any event, the guaranty herein expressed shall
not be sole and exclusive, and is additional to any other guaranty or warranty expressed or
implied.

AFFIDAVIT OR CERTIFICATE

Contractor shall furnish any affidavit or certificate in connection with the work covered
by this Contract as required by law.

NOTICES

Any notice required to be given by this Contract shall be deemed sufficient if made in
writing and sent by certified mail, return receipt requested, by personal service, or by email
transmission to the persons and addresses indicated below or to such addresses and
persons as either party hereto shall notify the other party of in writing pursuant to the
provisions of this Section:

To the Village: To Contractor:

Village Manager Robert Davis

Village of Oak Park Davis Tree Care and Landscape, Inc.
123 Madison St. 7459 Franklin St.

0Oak Park, lllinois 60302-4272 Forest Park, IL 60130

Email: villagemanager@oak-park.us Email: davistreecare@gmail.com

Mailing of such notice as and when above provided shall be equivalent to personal
notice and shall be deemed to have been given at the time of mailing.

Notice by email transmission shall be effective as of date and time of transmission,
provided that the notice transmitted shall be sent on business days during business
hours (9:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. Chicago time). In the event email notice is transmitted
during non-business hours, the effective date and time of notice is the first hour of the
first business day after transmission.

AUTHORITY TO EXECUTE
The individuals executing this Contract on behalf of Contractor and the Village represent

that they have the legal power, right, and actual authority to bind their respective
parties to the terms and conditions of this Contract.
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EFFECTIVE DATE

The effective date of this Contract as reflected above and below shall be the date that
the Village Manager executes this Contract on behalf of the Village.

ENTIRE CONTRACT; APPROVAL OF SUBCONTRACTORS

This Contract, including the documents incorporated by reference herein, sets forth the
entire Contract between the parties with respect to the accomplishment of the Work. No
right or interest in this Contract shall be assigned, in whole or in part, by either party
without the prior written consent of the other party. The Village reserves the right to
approve the use of subcontractors to complete any portion of the Work and to approve
any applicable contract between Contractor and a proposed subcontractor to perform any
of the Work. This Contract shall be binding upon the parties and upon their respective
heirs, executors, administrators, personal representatives, successors, and assigns, except
as herein provided.

INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR

Contractor shall have the full contro! of the ways and means of performing the Work
referred to above and that the Contractor and its employees, representatives or
subcontractors are not employees of the Village, it being specifically agreed that the
Contractor bears the relationship of an independent contractor to the Village. The
Contractor shall solely be responsible for the payment of all salaries, benefits and costs
of supplying personnel for the Work.

CONTRACT BOND

Before commencing the work on the Project, Contractor shall furnish a Contract Bond.
The Contract Bond shall be in an amount of twenty-five thousand dollars ($25,000.00) as
security for the faithful performance of its obligations pursuant to the Contract
Documents and as security for the payment of all persons performing labor and
furnishing materials in connection with the Contract Documents. Such bond shall be on
a standard AIA document, shall be issued by a surety satisfactory to the Village, and shall
name the Village as a primary co-obligee. The Contract Bond shall become a part of the
Contract Documents. The failure of Contractor to supply the required Contract Bond
within ten (10) days after the Notice of Award or within such extended period as the
Village may grant if the Contract Bond does not meet its approval shall constitute a
default, and the Village may either award the Contract to the next lowest responsible
proposer or re-advertise for proposals. A charge against Contractor may be made for
the difference between the amount of Contractor’s Proposal and the amount for which
a contract for the Work is subsequently executed, irrespective of whether the amount
thus due exceeds the amount of the bid guarantee.
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GOVERNING LAW AND VENUE

This Contract shall be governed by the laws of the State of lllinois both as to
interpretation and performance. Venue for any action pursuant to this Contract shall be
in the Circuit Court of Cook County, lllinols.

AMENDMENTS AND MODIFICATIONS

This Contract may be modified or amended from time-to-time provided, however, that
no such amendment or modification shall be effective unless reduced to writing and
duly authorized and signed by the authorized representative of the Village and the
authorized representative of the Contractor.

NON-WAIVER OF RIGHTS

No failure of either party to exercise any power given to it hereunder or to insist upon
strict compliance by the other party with its obligations hereunder, and no custom or
practice of the parties at variance with the terms hereof, nor any payment under this
Contract shall constitute a waiver of either party's right to demand exact compliance
with the terms hereof.

CONFLICT

In case of a conflict between any provision(s) of the Village’s Request for Proposals or
the Contractor’s Proposal and this Contract, this Contract and the Village's Request for
Proposals shall control to the extent of such conflict.

HEADINGS AND TITLES

The headings and titles provided in this Contract are for convenience only and shall not
be deemed a part of this Contract.

COOPERATION OF THE PARTIES

The Village and Contractor shali cooperate in the provision of the Work to be provided
by Contractor pursuant to this Contract and in compliance with applicable laws,
including, but not limited to, the Illinois Freedom of Information Act, 5 ILCS 140/1 et seq.
(“FOIA”), and the provision of any documents and information pursuant to a FOIA
request. Contractor shall provide any and all responsive documents to the Village
pursuant to a FOIA request at no cost to the Village.



24,

25.

26.

CERTIFIED PAYROLL

Contractor shall be solely responsibie to maintain accurate records reflecting its payroll
for its employees who perform any of the Work for the Village pursuant to this Contract
and shall submiit certified payroll records to the Village's Director of Public Works at any
time during the term of this Contract. Contractor shall provide said certified payroll
records within seven {7) days upon the request of the Director of Public Works.

COUNTERPARTS; FACSIMILE OR PDF SIGNATURES

This Contract may be executed in counterparts, each of which shall be considered an
original and together shall be one and the same Contract. A facsimile or pdf copy of this
Agreement and any signature(s) thereon will be considered for all purposes as an
original.

STANDARD OF CARE

Contractor shall endeavor to perform the Work with the same skill and judgment which

can be reasonably expected from similarly situated firms or entities.

[REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK -
SIGNATURE PAGE FOLLOWS]
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused this Contract to be signed by their

duly authorized representatives on the dates set forth below.

VILLAGE OF OAK PARK
By: Cara Pavlicek

Its: Village Manager

Date: Dc.(, /ST 2017

ATTEST

Uets Seanmaar

By:  Vicki Scaman
its:  Village Clerk

Date: fhc. (S5~ 2017

DAVIS TREE CARE AND LANDSCAPE,
INCORPORATED

DateTYC: A0 ,2017

ATTEST

NN N
By: Tl EANTLD
Its: s>l A\Celi&a @

Date: T ¢ . 280 , 2017

UGt Leec

YANETH LARA
Official Seal

Notary Public - State of llingis
My Commission Expires Apr 5, 2021
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D18 Pa 3 e P E
T ek il [ A&BTree Sarvice Inc. Davis Tree Care Inc. Kramer Tree Experts lnc. The Care of Tree Inc. Winkler Tree Inc,
Unit | unit | _ Unit Unit Unit
D.BH Est. | ! T
No st # Price | Total by class Price Total by class Price Tt?tal by ¢ ass. Price T_otal byclass | . Total by class
1 6"-12" 1213 No Bid | NoBid . 52500 | $  30,325.00 | No Bid No Bid $71.76 | & B87,044838] $35.00 | $  42,455.00
2 12.1"-20" 1415 No Bid Mo Bid $48.00 ; 8 67,920.00] NoBid No Bid $95.25 | § 134,778.75 | $79.00 | $ 111,785.00
3 20.1"-30" 777 No Bid No Bid $75.00 1 S _58,275.00 | No pid NoBid $14456: 5 112,323.12 $124.00{ §  96,348.00
4 | 30.1" ang Over 226 !‘-Io Bid No Bid 39‘!"1_90 S 21,470.00 _l\_l(_')_ Eld No Bid $372.747 6 84,239.24 S:}43.00 5  33,448.00
Total]L1 5 - JEETT 5 177,9%0.00 5 - .15 41838599 15 284,036.00
D18 i g Out R P D
2 men Chipper truck w/chipper ~ No Bid - 5240.00 i No Bid - $190.00 $250.00
1 man Aerlal Lift Truck ___NoBid . 513500 | No Bid B _ 59500 i 617500 B
1 man Log Loader ___NoBid . $135.00 . No Bid 5125.00 515000 B
1 man Semi Tractor-traller No Bid _ $135.00 N No Bid . $190.00 5175.00
Laborer Mo 8id $105.00 Mo Bid 595.00 $100.00
018 P e 2o
7 z= 1 A&BTree Servicelnc, | Davis Tr_ee_CarE Ing. | Kramer Tree Experts Inc. | The Careof TreeInc. | Winkler Tree Inc.
No. DBH g\:: Est. #18ld Price| Total by class |Bid Price. Total bv class |Bid Price| Total by class |Bid Price| Total by class |Bid Prlce Total by class
S M N — J—. —
1 0"-11" 9 20 $3.00 }‘"g 540.00 1 $4.00 E 720 00 Mo Bid Mo Bid “No Bid ~ No Bid No Bid l No Bid
2 11,1"-18" 16 60 | $750 |5 7,200.00 $8.00 5 7 £80.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid ~ No Bid No Bid | | No Bid
3 18.1"-24" 215) 65 | 51100;$ 1537250 513 00 S . 18 167.50 | No Bid NoBd ) NoBd| No Bid No Bid ' _ NoBid
4 24.1"-30" 265 40 |513.00:5 13,780.00 SlS_C_)Q S 15900.00 | NoBid No Bid No Bid | No 8id No Big ’ “Noegid N
5 | 301°-3" | 325] 10 | $i7.00 |5 552500 51800 | S 5850.00 | NoBid NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 361" 41 | 10 | 517005 69700052000 S 820000} NoBid NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total| L0 € 49,387.50 s 56,517.50 [N S - | S - | s -
018 4 #
Bl — ) | A& BTreeService Inc. Davis Tree Care tnc. | Kramer Tree Experts Inc. The Care of Tree Inc. Winkler TreeInc.
No. DBH AD‘:: Est. #]Bid Prlce' Total by class |Bid Prlce% Total by class |Bid Price| Total by class }Bid Pru:el Total by class |Bid Pricel‘ Total by class
1 011" 9 | 20 § 6750 ; § 135000 5250 | $ 450,00 | No Bid Nogid | NoBid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid
2 11.1"-18" 16 30 | 5115076 5,520.00 | 51400 | § 6,720.00 | No Bid No Bid | Mo Bid No Bld No Bid N 8id
3 18.1"-24" 21 65 | 51950 [$ 26,617.50| 521.00 | §  28,665.00 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 24.1"-30" 27 55 | 52300 % 34,15500| 52500 | §  37,125.00 | NoBid No Bld Na Bid No Bid Mo Bid NoBid |
5 30.1"-36" 33 60 | 52850 | 5 56,430.00 | $29.00 | §  57,420.00 | No Bid No Bid | Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld
6 36.1" 41| 40 | 35005 57,0000 § $37.00 [  60,680.00 | No @id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Toral] 70 1§ 18147250 | $  191,060.00 | s - | 15 - | . 3 .
(018 P O ( Rates P 0
2 men Chipper truck w/chipper 518000 5240.00 No Bid No Bid * NoBid
1 man Aerial Lift Truck $120.00 B $135.00 _ NoBid Mo Bid B No Bid
1 man Log Loader 5120.00 H _$135.00 ___NoBid ~_Nogd No Bid .
1 man Semi Tractor-trailer $120.00 $135.00 MNoBid | ~~ HNoBid ~ No Bid
Laborer $50.00 $105.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
013 P i R 0
e A B B Tree Service Inc. Davis Tree Care Inc. Kramer Trea Experts Inc. The Care of Tree Inc. Winkler Tree Inc,
No. Grind Type Est. # Bid Price Tota! Bid Price| Total Bid Price Total Bid Price Total Bid Price Tetal
Full Grind $246.00) § 159,900.00 |$325.00] $ 211,250.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Parkway Restoration with Sod

2018 Parkway Restoraticn Rate per Square Yard
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CORPORATION FILE DETAIL REPORT

JossEWaiE | o

' Fite Number || 60503805
t-. e o S oy Tl
| Entity Hame | | DAVIS TREE CARE AND LANDSCAPE, MCORPORATED
[Emc e mr ot S = = | |
. -s'ﬁt_i_:s | ACTIVE
Entlty"l'ype | corpoRATION ' Type of Corp | DOMESTIC BCA
| Incorporation Datel | 05/19/1999 | State : ' LLWOIS
(Domestvc) J ' { _
Agent Hame . ROBERT R DAVIS : \ Agent Change Date | 0472972008
Agent Street Address | 7741 ONROE President Name 8 ' ROBERT R DAVIS 7741
; | Address | WONROE FOREST PARK
| : . . 60130
A_gent city, | FOREST PARK ; Secretary Hame & :
. Addresa
S et i 25 i = s
Agent I p 60130 i Du ration.Daté | | PERPETUAL
Annual Re pori E‘Img 051272017 ! f-gi' -‘i’gai' 2017
; Date |
Retumn to the Search Screen (1. Purchasa Centifiate of Good Standing |
(One Certificate per Transaction)
OTHER SERVICES

| File Anmual Report. |

| Adopting Assumed Name |

| Articles of Amendment Effecting A Name Change - |

| Change of Ragistered.Agent and/or Registesed Office Address |




Warrenville
. 27201 Bella Vista Pkwy Ste 310
lecrl‘y Warrenville, lllinois 60555
+1(866) 4569584 Fax: +1 (866) 5474877
Mutual (668 b

SURETY

CONTINUATION CERTIFICATE

To be attached lo and lorm a part of surety bond number 404019839

for  Village of Oak Park Parkway Tree Removal Contract #15-100

(the "Bond"), cross reference bond number

datedthe __ 3 dayof August, 2016 in the panal sum of § 25,000.00 issued by

The Chio Casualty Insurance Company

as surety (the "Surety”), on behalf of

Davis Tree Care, Inc. as principal (the "Principal™), in favor of Village of Oak Park, as obligee {the "Obligee”).

31st

The Surety hereby cerlifies that this Bond is continued in fult force and effect until the day of

December, 2018

, subject to all covenants and conditions of said Bond.

Said Bond has been continued in force upon the express condition that the full extent of the Surety's liability under said
Bond, and this and all continuations thereof, for any loss or series of losses occurring during the entire time the Surety

remains on said Bond, shall in no event, either individually or in the aggregate, exceed the penal sum of the Bond.

2nd October, 2017

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Surety has set its hand and seal this day of

The Ohio Casualty Insurance Company
{Surety)

By: (-T‘Q& 'QQ' o

Timothy A. Mikolajewski
Assistant Secrelary - Liberty Mutual Surety

LMIC - 3300
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Agenda Item Summary

File # RES 1&-708./version: 1

Submitted By
John P. Wielebnicki, Director of Public Works

Reviewed By
CLP

Agenda Item Title

A Resolution Approving an Independent Contractor Agreement with Davis Tree Care and Landscape,
Incorporated for Fiscal Year 2018 Parkway Tree Removal in an Amount not to Exceed $190,000.00 and
Authorizing its Execution

Overview

The Village has over 18,000 public trees on parkways and in other public spaces. Each year a portion of those
trees need to be removed due to disease (Dutch elm disease), insect infestation (Emerald ash borer), storm
damage and senescence. The Village contracts for these services through a year-long contract that invoices at
different rates depending on the season. Tree removal contractors are also called on to provide emergency
services such as storm damage clean-up and emergency tree removal.

Staff Recommendation
Approve the Resolution.

Fiscal Impact
The proposed FY 2018 budget recommends a total of $350,000.00 for Parkway Tree Removal and $50.000.00
for Storm Clean-up in the General Fund, External Support account no. 1001-43800-741-530667.

Background

The majority of tree removals within the Village have historically been contracted out. Tree removal contracts
assist the village in a number of ways. They reduce loss by allowing staff to focus on identification of diseased
trees and preventive care. They reduce liability by allowing contractors with appropriate equipment and staff
to remove larger trees. Lastly, they enhance in-house customer service by enabling crews to respond to
pruning and other requests more quickly and efficiently.

In 2011, the village began to bid out two separate season rate groups for removal. The development of these
winter removal rates has resulted in significant cost saving for the village.

A&B Landscaping and Tree Service, Inc. and Davis Tree Care, Inc. were the low and second low bidder in the
summer and winter rate groups.

Experience over the last several years has determined that a single contractor can have difficulty keeping pace
with removals and storm damage demands, especially if weather conditions for the season are severe. Staff
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RESOLUTION

A RESOLUTION APPROVING AN INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR AGREEMENT WITH DAVIS TREE
CARE AND LANDSCAPE, INCORPORATED FOR FISCAL YEAR 2018 PARKWAY TREE REMOVAL IN
AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $190,000.00 AND AUTHORIZING ITS EXECUTION

BE IT RESOLVED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village of Oak Park, Cook
County, State of lllinois {“Village”), in the exercise of their home rule powers, that the
Independent Contractor Agreement {“Agreement”) with Davis Tree Care and Landscape,
Incorporated for fiscal year 2018 Parkway Tree Removal Services is approved in an amount not
to exceed $190,000.00 and the Village Manager is authorized to execute the Agreement in
substantially the form attached.

THIS RESOLUTION shall be in full force and effect from and after its adoption and
approval as provided by law.

ADOPTED this 11*" day of December, 2017, pursuant to a roll call vote as follows:

Voting A
President Abu-Taleb
Trustee Andrews
Trustee Boutet
Trustee Button
Trustee Moroney
Trustee Taglia
Trustee Tucker

APPROVED this 11" day of Dec%-

Anan Abu-Taleb, Village President

Nay Abstain Absent

-
(1]

NNRNERARIN

ATTEST /

ViaksiRarman

Vicki Scaman, Village Clerk




