0 d
Davis Tree Care |I'IC._ i

(e s A& BTreeServicelnc. | C KramerTree Expents Inc. | TheCareof Treelnc. | Winkler Treglnc.
No. D.BH Est. ¥ ;‘:_?:: Total by class :?:: | Total by class ;’:;:: Total by class ::: | Total by class ;?ci; Total by class
1 612" 1213 | NoBid | NoBid $2500 |5 30,32500 | NoBid |  NoBd $71.76 | $ 8704488 | 535008  42.455.00
2 12.1%20" 1455 | NoBd No Bid $48.00 [ § 67.92000 | NoBid | NoBid $95.25 | 5 134,778.75| 579.00 | § 111,785.00
3 20.1"-30" 777 No Bid No Bid $75.00 | § 5827500 | NoBid | ~ NoBd . 514456| § 112,323.12 | $124.00{ §  56,348.00
4 1 30.1" and Over 226 No Bid No Bid $95.00 | § 2147000 | NoBid |  NoBild 537274 5 84,239.24|514800] 5 33,448.00
Total:| EEEET § - |EESENE s 177.950.00 | I U s 418,385.99 | § 284,036.00
2018 Cycle Pruning Emergency Call Out Rates Per Hour
2 men Chipper truck w/chipper No Bld i $240.00 ____ NoBid 5190.00 5250.00

1 rnan Aerial Uift Truck No Bid i T5135.00 i No Bid 595.00 $175.00 |

2 man Log Loader No Bid §135.00 1 NoBid §125.00

1 man Semi Tractor-traller No Bid __$135.00  NoBid 5190.00

Laborer

No Bid

A& BTree Service Inc. |

5105.00

Davis Tree Care Inc.

2018 Winter Parkway Tree Removals
_Kramer Tree Experts Inc. |

No Bid

$95.00

The Care of Tree Inc.
ErAEM TR L

Winkler Tree Inc.
T

20138 Parkway Tree Removal Emerge

sl :
Na. D.BH ;‘i’: Est. #|Bid Price| Totalbyclass |Bid Price] Totalbyclass |Bid Price| Totalby class |Bid Price| Totalbyclass |Bid Price| Total by class
1 0™-11" 9 | 20| $3.00 [ 54000 $400 {5 72000 | NoBid NoBd | NoBid NoBid | NoBid NoBid
2 11.1™18" 16 | 60 | $750 {S  7,20000| $8.00 [ § 768000 | NoBid NoBd | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 18.1"-24" |215| 65 1$11.00(3% 1537250513003 18,167.50 | NoBid | NoBid | NaBid No Bid Ne Bld No Bid
4 24.130"  J265[ 40 | s13.00/% 1378000 $1500 | § 1590000 | No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid |
5 30.1"-36" §325[ 10 | 61700} 5 552500|%18.00! 5 585000 | No®id No Bid NoBld |  NoBid No Bid No Bid
6 36.1" 41 | 10 |$17.00;5 6570.00|52000}5 8720000 | NoBid No Bid NoBid |  NoBid ‘No Bid No Bid
Total|INTI0 S 45,387.50 §  56517.50 | 5 i B - | 3 -
014 P Remo
i ~. It A&BTreeService!nc, Davis Tree Care Inc. Kramer Tree Experts Inc. The Care of Tree Inc. Winkler Tree Inc.
______ ; TR tn | R c. | ¥ ‘Vreelnc. |
No. DEBH g:: Est. #|Bid Price| Totalby class |Bid Price| Totalby class |Bid Price| Total by class |Bid PrlceI Total by class [Bid Price] Total by class
| e I S .
1 0"-11" 9 | 20 | 5750 |5 135000 s250 [§ 450.00 | NoBid No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bld NoBid
2 11.1"-18" 16 | 30 | 51150 $ 552000 51400 $  6,720.00 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid |
3 18.1"-24" 21 | 65 | 51950 %  26.617.50)] $21.00 | $  28,665.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 24,1307 27 | 55 | $2300[S 3415500 52500) S  37,125.00 | NoBid NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 30.1°-36" 33 | 60 | 528505 5643000 | $29.00 | § 57,420.00 | NoBid No Bid NoBid |  NoBid No Bid No Bid
6 36.1"- 41 | 40 |s3500[$ 57.400.00 [ $37.00[ 5  60,680.00 | No Bid No 8id NoBid |  NoBid No Bid No Bid
Total:|] 5 181,472.50 15 191,060.00 |IZ s - | s - 'B -

2 men Chipper truck w/chipper si8000 | ~ 5240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 man Aerial Lift Truck $120.00 ) $135.00 No Bid T Nogid No Bid
1 man Log Loader 512000 | 313500 NoBid ' No Bid No Bid _
1 man Semi Tractor-traller $120.00 B $135.00  NopBid i No Bid _ NeBld |
Labarer $50.00 $105.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
(318 P p R 0
= i A & B Tree Service Inc. Davis Trea Care Ing. Kramer Tree Experts Inc. The Care of Tree Inc. Winkler Tree Inc.
Grind Type Est. # Bid Price Total Bid Price Total fid Price| Total Bid Price Total Bid Price Total
Full Grind 650 $246.00) § 159,900.00 |5325.00| 5 211,250.00 Nao Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid

Parkway Restoration with Sod

2018 Parkway Restaration Rate per Square Yard






