
Num. Scientific Name Common Name Size
No. of 
Plants Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 Agastache 'Arizona Sandstone' Arizona Sandstone Agastache 1 Gal 82 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $557.60 $6.50 $533.00 No Bid No Bid $4.50 $369.00 $25.17 $2,063.94 $27.00 $2,214.00
2 Allium schoenoprasum 'Forescate' Forescate Chives 4.5" 218 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $675.80 $3.80 $828.40 No Bid No Bid $4.60 $1,002.80 $2.64 $575.52 $31.00 $6,758.00
3 Alocasia 'Regal Shields' Regal Shields Elephant Ear 3 Gal 77 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $30.00 $2,310.00 $20.00 $1,540.00 No Bid No Bid $37.50 $2,887.50 $23.99 $1,847.23 $65.65 $5,055.05
4 Alpinia zerumbet 'Variegata' Shell Ginger 3 Gal 36 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $30.00 $1,080.00 $20.00 $720.00 No Bid No Bid $49.50 $1,782.00 $23.64 $851.04 $83.15 $2,993.40
5 Angelonia angustifolia 'Serena Blue' Serena Blue Angelonia 4.5" 207 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $641.70 $3.80 $786.60 No Bid No Bid $4.50 $931.50 $6.61 $1,368.27 $8.25 $1,707.75
6 Asparagus densiflorus 'Myers' Foxtail Fern 1 Gal 82 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $557.60 $10.00 $820.00 No Bid No Bid $16.50 $1,353.00 $17.68 $1,449.76 $27.00 $2,214.00
7 Begonia boliviensis 'Mistral Red' Red Mistral Begonia 4.5" 24 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.50 $84.00 $4.60 $110.40 No Bid No Bid $4.50 $108.00 $5.55 $133.20 $14.20 $340.80
8 Begonia hybrida Summerwings Vanilla Summerwings Vanilla Begonia 4.5" 267 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.50 $934.50 $4.60 $1,228.20 No Bid No Bid $4.50 $1,201.50 $7.44 $1,986.48 $12.45 $3,324.15
9 Begonia hybrida 'Funky Orange' Funky Orange Begonia 4.5" 81 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.50 $283.50 $4.60 $372.60 No Bid No Bid $4.50 $364.50 $7.53 $609.93 $12.45 $1,008.45

10 Browallia 'Endless Illumination' Amethyst Flower 4.5" 43 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $133.30 $4.60 $197.80 No Bid No Bid $5.20 $223.60 $7.44 $319.92 $11.00 $473.00
11 Caladium candidum 'Senior White' Senior White Caladium 3 Gal 51 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $25.00 $1,275.00 $15.00 $765.00 No Bid No Bid $38.00 $1,938.00 $12.70 $647.70 $67.80 $3,457.80
12 Calibrachoa Superbells Blue Moon Punch Blue Moon Punch Calibrachoa 4.5" 333 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $1,032.30 $4.60 $1,531.80 No Bid No Bid $4.50 $1,498.50 $5.84 $1,944.72 $8.60 $2,863.80
13 Calibrachoa Superbells Tangerine Punch Tangerine Punch Calibrachoa 4.5" 63 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $195.30 $2.80 $176.40 No Bid No Bid $4.50 $283.50 $7.77 $489.51 $8.60 $541.80
14 Calibrachoa Superbells Coralina Coralina Calibrachoa 4.5" 201 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $623.10 $4.60 $924.60 No Bid No Bid $4.50 $904.50 $5.84 $1,173.84 $8.60 $1,728.60
15 Canna x generalis 'Bronze Scarlet' CANNOVA® Bronze Scarlet Canna Lily 3 Gal 106 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $25.00 $2,650.00 $20.00 $2,120.00 No Bid No Bid $37.50 $3,975.00 $19.43 $2,059.58 $58.65 $6,216.90
16 Cleome 'Senorita Blanca' Senorita Blanca Cleome 1 Gal 138 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $938.40 $6.50 $897.00 No Bid No Bid $10.40 $1,435.20 $16.22 $2,238.36 $20.90 $2,884.20
17 Cordyline fruticosa 'Sensation' Sensation Cordyline 3 Gal 35 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $30.00 $1,050.00 $20.00 $700.00 No Bid No Bid $37.50 $1,312.50 $20.02 $700.70 $65.65 $2,297.75
18 Cuphea hyssopifolia Mexican Heather 4.5" 60 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $186.00 $3.80 $228.00 No Bid No Bid $4.50 $270.00 $5.61 $336.60 $7.00 $420.00
19 Dahlia 'Gardenetta' Dark Red Gardenetta Dark Red Dahlia 1 Gal 84 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $571.20 $6.50 $546.00 No Bid No Bid $9.90 $831.60 $11.38 $955.92 $20.90 $1,755.60
20 Dahlia hybrida 'Mystic Illusion' Mystic Illusion Dahlia 1 Gal 139 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $945.20 $6.50 $903.50 No Bid No Bid $9.90 $1,376.10 $11.38 $1,581.82 $27.20 $3,780.80
21 Dichondra argentea  'Silver Falls' Silver Falls Dichondra 4.5" 290 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $899.00 $3.80 $1,102.00 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $1,276.00 $5.80 $1,682.00 $8.75 $2,537.50
22 Dracaena marginata 'Colorama' Colorama Varigated Dracaena 3 Gal 51 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $30.00 $1,530.00 $15.00 $765.00 No Bid No Bid $36.80 $1,876.80 $18.73 $955.23 $70.00 $3,570.00
23 Evolvulus hybrid 'Blue My Mind' Dwarf Morning Glory 4.5" 340 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $1,054.00 $4.60 $1,564.00 No Bid No Bid $4.50 $1,530.00 $5.98 $2,033.20 $10.40 $3,536.00
24 Felicia amelloides 'Forever Blue' Blue Felicia Daisy 4.5" 96 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $297.60 $3.80 $364.80 No Bid No Bid $7.12 $683.52 $7.57 $726.72 $16.00 $1,536.00
25 Gaura lindheimeri 'Geyser White' Geyser White Gaura 1 Gal 133 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $904.40 $6.50 $864.50 No Bid No Bid $11.20 $1,489.60 $6.44 $856.52 $19.30 $2,566.90
26 Impatiens x 'Patchwork' Patchwork Impatiens 4.5" 212 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $657.20 $3.80 $805.60 No Bid No Bid $4.50 $954.00 $5.74 $1,216.88 $8.80 $1,865.60
27 Ipomoea 'SolarPower Red Heart' SolarPower Red Heart Sweet Potato 4.5" 92 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $285.20 $3.80 $349.60 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $404.80 $5.65 $519.80 $9.30 $855.60
28 Lantana 'Cherry Sunrise' Cherry Sunrise Lantana 1 Gal 22 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $149.60 $6.50 $143.00 No Bid No Bid $4.60 $101.20 $12.26 $269.72 $19.30 $424.60
29 Lobelia 'Techo Heat Upright Dark Blue' Techo Heat Dark Blue Lobelia 4.5" 43 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $133.30 $3.80 $163.40 No Bid No Bid $4.30 $184.90 $10.00 $430.00 $8.40 $361.20
30 Lysimachia nummularia Goldilocks Creeping Jenny 4.5" 0 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $0.00 $3.80 $0.00 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $8.25 $0.00
31 Osteospernum 'Orange Symphony' Orange African Daisy 8" 198 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $1,346.40 $6.50 $1,287.00 No Bid No Bid $13.00 $2,574.00 $6.32 $1,251.36 $32.40 $6,415.20
32 Pelargonium  'Americana Salmon' Americana Salmon Geranium 1 Gal 77 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $523.60 $6.50 $500.50 No Bid No Bid $10.10 $777.70 $11.38 $876.26 $20.20 $1,555.40
33 Pennisetum setaceum 'Rubrum' Purple Fountain Grass 1 Gal 73 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $496.40 $6.50 $474.50 No Bid No Bid $9.50 $693.50 $17.14 $1,251.22 $21.90 $1,598.70
34 Pentas lanceolata 'Butterfly Red' Butterfly Red Pentas 4.5" 49 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $151.90 $3.80 $186.20 No Bid No Bid $4.50 $220.50 $5.80 $284.20 $7.90 $387.10
35 Petunia hybrida 'Blanket Red' Blanket Red Petunia 4.5" 196 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $607.60 $4.60 $901.60 No Bid No Bid $4.50 $882.00 $5.80 $1,136.80 $8.75 $1,715.00
36 Petunia superpetunia 'Honey' Honey Petunia 4.5" 23 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $71.30 $4.60 $105.80 No Bid No Bid $4.30 $98.90 $5.65 $129.95 $8.75 $201.25
37 Petunia superpetunia 'Picasso in Purple' Picasso in Purple Petunia 4.5" 157 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $486.70 $4.60 $722.20 No Bid No Bid $4.30 $675.10 $5.65 $887.05 $9.30 $1,460.10
38 Plectranthus 'Plepalila' Mona Lavender Swedish Ivy 1 Gal 52 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $10.65 $553.80 $6.50 $338.00 No Bid No Bid $10.90 $566.80 $16.58 $862.16 $21.90 $1,138.80
39 Salvia 'Balsalmisp' Mystic Spires Blue Salvia 1 Gal 122 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $10.65 $1,299.30 $6.50 $793.00 No Bid No Bid $10.10 $1,232.20 $12.74 $1,554.28 $22.80 $2,781.60
40 Salvia nemorosa Color Spires 'Crystal Blue' Crystal Blue Salvia 1 Gal 211 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $10.65 $2,247.15 $6.00 $1,266.00 No Bid No Bid $10.10 $2,131.10 $12.74 $2,688.14 $20.20 $4,262.20
41 Salvia Summer Jewel Red Summer Jewel Red Salvia 4.5" 184 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $570.40 $3.80 $699.20 No Bid No Bid $4.40 $809.60 $5.61 $1,032.24 $16.70 $3,072.80
42 Solenostemon scutellarioides 'Colorblaze Sedona' Colorblaze Sedona 8" 184 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $1,251.20 $6.50 $1,196.00 No Bid No Bid $9.00 $1,656.00 $5.55 $1,021.20 $23.70 $4,360.80
43 Solenostemon scutellarioides 'Fishnet Stockings' Fishnet Stockings Coleus 8" 85 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $578.00 $6.50 $552.50 No Bid No Bid $9.00 $765.00 $5.55 $471.75 $23.70 $2,014.50
44 Solenostemon scutellarioides 'Freckles' Freckles Coleus 8" 50 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $340.00 $6.50 $325.00 No Bid No Bid $9.00 $450.00 $5.55 $277.50 $23.70 $1,185.00
45 Solenostemon scutellarioides 'Lime Time' Lime Time Coleus 8" 98 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $666.40 $6.50 $637.00 No Bid No Bid $9.00 $882.00 $5.55 $543.90 $23.70 $2,322.60
46 Solenostemon scutellarioides 'Wasabi' Wasabi Coleus 8" 26 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $176.80 $6.50 $169.00 No Bid No Bid $9.00 $234.00 $5.55 $144.30 $23.70 $616.20
47 Strobilantes dyerianus Persian Shield 1 Gal 16 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $10.65 $170.40 $6.50 $104.00 No Bid No Bid $9.00 $144.00 $15.81 $252.96 $19.80 $316.80
48 Torenia 'Summer Wave Large Blue Large Blue Wishbone Flower 4.5" 15 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $46.50 $4.60 $69.00 No Bid No Bid $4.20 $63.00 $6.10 $91.50 $8.40 $126.00
49 Verbena Aztec 'Silver Magic' Silver Magic Aztec Verbena 4.5" 62 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $192.20 $3.80 $235.60 No Bid No Bid $4.50 $279.00 $5.71 $354.02 $9.45 $585.90
50 Zinnia Magellan 'Ivory' Ivory Zinnia 1 Gal 144 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $979.20 $6.50 $936.00 No Bid No Bid $11.20 $1,612.80 $5.65 $813.60 $17.40 $2,505.60
51 Zinnia marylandica 'Zahara' Zahara™ Double Zinnia 1 Gal 318 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $2,162.40 $6.50 $2,067.00 No Bid No Bid $11.20 $3,561.60 $6.65 $2,114.70 $17.40 $5,533.20
52 Zinnia Zahara 'Starlight Rose' Starlight Rose Zinnia 1 Gal 119 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $809.20 $6.50 $773.50 No Bid No Bid $11.20 $1,332.80 $5.65 $672.35 $17.40 $2,070.60

No Bid DSQ $38,361.65 $36,389.80 No Bid $54,190.72 $50,735.55 $115,514.60

Num. Scientific Name Common Name Size
No. of 
Plants

1 Aster dumosus KICKIN Pink Chiffon Kickin Pink Chiffon 1 gal 282 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $1,917.60 $6.50 $1,833.00 No Bid No Bid $6.70 $1,889.40 $16.50 $4,653.00 $35.00 $9,870.00
2 Aster Frolic Frolic Aster 1 gal 600 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $6.80 $4,080.00 $6.50 $3,900.00 No Bid No Bid $6.70 $4,020.00 $16.50 $9,900.00 $35.00 $21,000.00
3 Beta vulgaris 'Oriole Gold' Oriole Gold Swiss Chard 1 gal 122 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $5.00 $610.00 $6.50 $793.00 No Bid No Bid $7.50 $915.00 $13.31 $1,623.82 $13.90 $1,695.80
4 Beta vulgaris 'Ruby Red' Ruby Red Swiss Chard 1 gal 89 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $5.00 $445.00 $6.50 $578.50 No Bid No Bid $7.50 $667.50 $13.31 $1,184.59 $13.90 $1,237.10
5 Brassica oleracea ‘Sunset' Kale Sunset 1 gal 48 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $4.60 $220.80 $6.50 $312.00 No Bid No Bid $6.80 $326.40 $9.66 $463.68 $27.20 $1,305.60
6 Brassica oleracea 'Pigeon Purple' Pigeon Purple Kale 1 gal 454 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $4.60 $2,088.40 $6.50 $2,951.00 No Bid No Bid $6.80 $3,087.20 $9.66 $4,385.64 $12.25 $5,561.50
7 Brassica oleracea 'Ruby Perfection' Ruby Perfection Kale 1 gal 138 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $4.60 $634.80 $6.50 $897.00 No Bid No Bid $7.20 $993.60 $11.99 $1,654.62 $15.75 $2,173.50
8 Capsiscum anum 'Chilly Chili' Chilly Chili Pepper 8" pot 85 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $8.60 $731.00 $6.50 $552.50 No Bid No Bid $9.50 $807.50 $12.74 $1,082.90 $16.30 $1,385.50
9 Celosia 'Dragon's Breath' Dragon's Breath Celosia 8" pot 42 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $8.60 $361.20 $6.50 $273.00 No Bid No Bid $12.50 $525.00 $14.50 $609.00 $15.75 $661.50

10 Celosia 'Fresh Look Orange' Fresh Look Orange Celosia 8" pot 48 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $8.60 $412.80 $6.50 $312.00 No Bid No Bid $12.50 $600.00 $14.50 $696.00 $24.00 $1,152.00
11 Chrysanthemum 'Aubrey Orange' Aubrey Orange Garden Mum 1 gal 631 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $5.25 $3,312.75 $6.50 $4,101.50 No Bid No Bid $6.70 $4,227.70 $14.79 $9,332.49 $14.90 $9,401.90
12 Chrysanthemum 'Edana Red' Edana Red Garden Mum 1 gal 300 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $5.25 $1,575.00 $6.50 $1,950.00 No Bid No Bid $6.70 $2,010.00 $15.79 $4,737.00 $14.40 $4,320.00
13 Chrysanthemum 'Fireglow Bronze' Fireglow Bronze Mum 1 gal 36 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $5.25 $189.00 $6.50 $234.00 No Bid No Bid $6.70 $241.20 $15.79 $568.44 $14.40 $518.40
14 Chrysanthemum Hilo Fuchsia Hilo Fuchsia Garden Mum 1 gal 345 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $5.25 $1,811.25 $6.50 $2,242.50 No Bid No Bid $6.70 $2,311.50 $15.79 $5,447.55 $14.40 $4,968.00
15 Chrysanthemum 'Key Lime' Key Lime Garden Mum 1 gal 20 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $5.25 $105.00 $6.50 $130.00 No Bid No Bid $6.70 $134.00 $15.65 $313.00 $14.40 $288.00
16 Kalanchoe Orange Orange Kalanchoe 4.5" 119 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $4.80 $571.20 $4.70 $559.30 No Bid No Bid $7.30 $868.70 $8.92 $1,061.48 $11.10 $1,320.90
17 Kalanchoe Yellow Yellow Kalanchoe 4.5" 399 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $4.80 $1,915.20 $4.70 $1,875.30 No Bid No Bid $7.30 $2,912.70 $8.92 $3,559.08 $11.10 $4,428.90
18 Pennisetum 'Fireworks' Fireworks Pennisetum 1 gal 276 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $8.60 $2,373.60 $12.00 $3,312.00 No Bid No Bid $9.50 $2,622.00 $17.14 $4,730.64 $21.90 $6,044.40
19 Pennisetum x Advena 'Rubrum' Burgundy Giant Fountaingrass 1 gal 54 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $8.60 $464.40 $12.00 $648.00 No Bid No Bid $9.50 $513.00 $17.64 $952.56 $21.90 $1,182.60
20 Tagetes erecta 'Garland Orange' Garland Orange Marigold 4" pot 126 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $390.60 $3.80 $478.80 No Bid No Bid $4.20 $529.20 $5.46 $687.96 $8.30 $1,045.80
21 Tagetes patula 'Bambino' Bambino Marigold 4" pot 711 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $2,204.10 $3.80 $2,701.80 No Bid No Bid $4.20 $2,986.20 $5.46 $3,882.06 $6.90 $4,905.90
22 Tagetes patula 'Bonanza Harmony' Bonanza Harmony  Marigolds 4" pot 240 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $744.00 $3.80 $912.00 No Bid No Bid $4.20 $1,008.00 $5.46 $1,310.40 $6.90 $1,656.00
23 Tagetes patula 'Super Hero Spry' Super Hero Spry Marigold 4" pot 458 No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ $3.10 $1,419.80 $3.80 $1,740.40 No Bid No Bid $4.50 $2,061.00 $5.46 $2,500.68 $6.90 $3,160.20

No Bid DSQ $28,577.50 $33,287.60 No Bid $36,256.80 $65,336.59 $89,283.50

No Bid DSQ $66,939.15 $69,677.40 No Bid $90,447.52 $116,072.14 $204,798.10
No Bid DSQ $0.00 $1,300.00 No Bid $1,470.00 $1,176.00 $9,810.00
No Bid DSQ $40.00 $39.00 No Bid $70.00 $39.00 $104.00

No Bid DSQ $94,939.15 $107,377.40 No Bid $151,207.52 $152,780.14 $356,078.10

Landscape Concepts McAdam Topiarius

Village of Oak Park
2020 Container Planting Installation and Maintenance Bid Summary

City Escape Cleanslate ChicagoA & B Landscaping Alvarez Christy Webber

Total VOP Areas Maintenance per Month:
Watering per Hour:

Total Cost for 2020:

2020 Summer Rotation - Quantity for Bidding Purposes Only

2020 Fall Rotation - Quantity for Bidding Purposes Only

Total Fall Rotation Cost:

Total Summer Rotation Cost:

Total Rotations Cost:

*Alvarez Disqualified for failure to fill out required bid documents*
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