Village of Oak Park
2020 Business District Landscape Maintenance Bid Summary

A & B Landscaping Inc. Alvarez Christy Webber City Escape Garden and Design
Spring Fall Clean | Total per | Total per | Spring Clean | Fall Clean Total per Fall Clean Total per Total per
Business District Clean Up Up Month Year Up Up Month Total per Year [ Spring Clean Up Up Month Total per Year |Spring Clean Up| Fall Clean Up | Month Total per Year
1|North Ave. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ DSQ DSQ $1,239.00 $675.00 $840.00 $8,634.00 $1,450.00 $500.00 $200.00 $3,550.00
2|Chicago Ave. East No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid DsQ DsQ DsQ DsQ $1,594.00 $525.00 $645.00 $7,279.00 $1,400.00 $550.00|  $500.00 $5,950.00
3[Chicago Ave. West No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ DSQ DSQ $816.00 $350.00 $460.00 $4,846.00 $275.00 $75.00 $65.00 $870.00
4|Lake St. East No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid DsQ DsQ DsQ DsQ $1,810.00 $440.00 $830.00 $8,890.00 $2,000.00 $750.00|  $325.00 $5,350.00
5]|Hemingway District No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ DSQ DSQ $1,463.00 $465.00 $825.00 $8,528.00 $2,000.00 $750.00 $325.00 $5,350.00
6|South Marion No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid DsQ DsQ DsQ DsQ $1,134.00 $550.00 $645.00 $6,844.00 $700.00 $175.00|  $196.00 $2,443.00
7[Madison St. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ DSQ DSQ $3,187.00 $765.00 $1,658.00 $17,216.00 $3,450.00 $750.00 $700.00 $9,800.00
8|Arts District No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid DsQ DSQ DsQ DsQ $2,161.00 $750.00|  $1,383.00 $13,975.00 $2,400.00 $850.00|  $600.00 $8,050.00
9[South Town No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ DSQ DSQ $763.00 $230.00 $280.00 $3,233.00 $600.00 $175.00 $150.00 $1,975.00
10{Roosevelt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid DsQ DsQ DsQ DsQ $1,561.00 $660.00 $835.00 $8,901.00 $1,450.00 $500.00|  $200.00 $3,550.00
11|Downtown Oak Park No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ DSQ DSQ $2,590.00 $700.00 $1,474.00 $15,082.00 $4,500.00 $1,250.00 $750.00 $11,750.00
Total for Year: No Bid DSQ $103,428.00 $58,638.00
Cleanslate Chicago Landscape Concepts McAdam Landscape Topiarius
Spring Fall Clean | Total per | Total per | Spring Clean | Fall Clean Total per Fall Clean Total per Total per
Business District Clean Up Up Month Year Up Up Month Total per Year [ Spring Clean Up Up Month Total per Year |Spring Clean Up| Fall Clean Up | Month Total per Year

1|North Ave. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $157.00 $157.00 $50.00 $714.00 $187.00 $100.00 $159.00 $1,559.00(No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2|Chicago Ave. East No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,082.00 $95.00 $220.00 $2,937.00 $1,130.00 $555.00 $477.00 $5,501.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3[Chicago Ave. West No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $310.00 $30.00 $68.00 $884.00 $264.00 $167.00 $53.00 $855.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4|Lake St. East No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,820.00 $158.00 $372.00 $4,954.00 $1,260.00 $721.00 $477.00 $5,797.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5]|Hemingway District No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $253.00 $25.00 $52.00 $694.00 $303.00 $333.00 $397.00 $3,812.00(No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6|South Marion No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,010.00 $90.00 $206.00 $2,748.00 $716.00 $388.00 $238.00 $3,008.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7[Madison St. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,763.00 $850.00 $2,000.00 $26,613.00 $2,240.00 $740.00 $477.00 $6,796.00(No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8|Arts District No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,390.00 $296.00 $698.00 $9,270.00 $1,890.00| $1,221.00 $636.00 $8,199.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9[South Town No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $420.00 $36.00 $86.00 $1,144.00 $264.00 $167.00 $159.00 $1,703.00(No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10{Roosevelt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $885.00 $77.00 $180.00 $2,402.00 $834.00 $444.00 $238.00 $3,182.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11|Downtown Oak Park No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,134.00 $446.00 $1,050.00 $13,980.00 $3,310.00( $1,110.00 $636.00 $9,508.00(No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total for Year: No Bid $66,340.00 $49,920.00 No Bid

*Alvarez Landscaping disqualified for failure to complete required bid documents*
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