
Maintenance Type
Estimated 

Area (sq. yd.)

Bid Price    
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month

Total per 
Year

Bid Price    
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

Bid Price    
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

Bid Price    
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

1 Turf Area 49,324.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ DSQ No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.10 $4,932.40 $39,459.20
2 Planter Bed Area 16,379.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid DSQ DSQ DSQ No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.20 $3,275.80 $26,206.40
3 No Bid DSQ No Bid $15,398.00
4 No Bid DSQ No Bid $4,696.00

No Bid DSQ No Bid $85,759.60

Maintenance Type
Estimated 

Area (sq. yd.)

Bid Price    
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month

Total per 
Year

Bid Price    
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

Bid Price    
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

Bid Price    
Sq. Yd 

/month
Total per 
Month Total per Year

1 Turf Area 49,324.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.10 $4,932.40 $39,459.20 $0.15 $7,398.60 $59,188.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Planter Bed Area 16,379.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.13 $2,129.27 $17,034.16 $0.12 $1,965.48 $15,723.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 No Bid $50,340.00 $6,260.00 No Bid
4 No Bid $5,780.00 $6,760.00 No Bid

No Bid $112,613.36 $87,932.64 No Bid

Village of Oak Park
2020 Regular Landscape Maintenance Bid Summary

Total for year: Total for year: Total for year: Total for year:

A & B Landscaping Inc. Alvarez, Inc. Christy Webber CityEscape Garden and Design

Spring Clean-up
Fall Clean-up

Spring Clean-up
Fall Clean-up

Cleanslate Chicago Landscape Concepts McAdam Landscape Topiarius

Total for year: Total for year: Total for year: Total for year:
*Alvarez Landscaping disqualified for failure to  complete required bid documents*
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