Village of Oak Park
Department of Public Works
Administration Division

MEMORANDUM
DATE: July 6, 2020
TO: John P. Wielebnicki, Director of Public Works
FROM: Diane Stanislavski, Budget & Revenue Analyst
Cc: Rob Sproule, Assistant Public Works Director
RE: Reduce PO due to Covid-19

Due to Covid-19 there has been a reduction in PO# 01825 for A & B Landscaping for
Parkway tree removals account number 1001-43800-741-530667 from $150,000 to
$100,000.

Thank you.
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Regular Village Board meetings are held at 7:30 p.m., the first and third Mondays of
each month in Council Chambers of Village Hall, 123 Madison St. When a regular
meeting falls on a holiday, the meeting typically is held the following night. The Village
Board also meets in special sessions, usually on the second and fourth Monday.
However, dates and times of special meetings can vary and may change.
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President and Board
—— In control:

e of Trustees
On agenda: 1/18/2019 Final action:

A Resolution Approving the Renewal of an Independent Contractor Agreement with A
Title: & B Landscaping and Tree Service, Inc. for Fiscal Year 2020 Parkway Tree Removal
Services in an Amount Not to Exceed $150,000.00 and Authorizing its Execution

1. Resolution-2020 Parkway Tree Removal-A&B Landscape and Tree, 2. Renewal-
Attachments: 2020 Parkway Tree Removal-A&B Landscape and Tree, 3. Attachment-A&B original
2017 agreement

History (0) Text

Submitted By
John P. Wielebnicki, Public Works Director

Reviewed By
LKS

Agenda Item Title

A Resolution Approving the Renewal of an Independent Contractor Agreement with A & B
Landscaping and Tree Service, Inc. for Fiscal Year 2020 Parkway Tree Removal Services in an
Amount Not to Exceed $150,000.00 and Authorizing its Execution

Overview

In December 2017 the Village Board approved entering into an Independent Contractor Agreement
with A&B Landscaping and Tree Service, Inc. for FY2018 Parkway Tree Removal Services. The
Agreement provides for two possible renewals. It is proposed to exercise the second of the two
possible renewals with A&B Landscaping and Tree Service, Inc. for FY2020 Parkway Tree Removal
Services.

https://oak-park.legistar.com/LegislationDetail.aspx?ID=4231671&GUID=618DA084-4... 11/18/2019
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Bg_commendation
Approve the Resolution.

Fiscal Impact
The proposed FY2020 budget recommends a total of $200,000.00 for Parkway Tree Removal and

$50,000.00 for Storm Clean-up in the General Fund, External Support account no. 1001-43800-741-
530667.

A total of $150,000.00 from this account is proposed to be awarded to A&B Landscaping and Tree
Service, Inc. for these services. An agreement with another tree removal contractor is proposed
under another agenda item.

Background

In September 2017 Village staff requested bids for three separate FY2018 tree maintenance
contracts under a “Comprehensive Tree Maintenance Bid” for services in 2018. A&B Landscaping
and Tree Service, Inc. of Riverside, IL was approved as one of the low responsive bidders for one of
the contracts, Parkway Tree Removal Services.

The Village has over 18,000 public trees on parkways and in other public spaces. Each year a
portion of those trees need to be removed due to disease (Dutch elm disease), insect infestation
(Emerald ash borer), storm damage and senescence. The Village contracts for these services
through a year-long contract that invoices at different rates depending on the season. Tree removal
contractors are also called on to provide emergency services such as storm damage clean-up and
emergency tree removal.

Experience over the last several years has determined that a single contractor can have difficulty
keeping pace with removals and storm damage demands, especially if weather conditions for the
season are severe. Staff has started the practice of contracting with multiple contractors for
removal contracts to assure removal within a timely manner and meeting the goals before the end
of the contract period.

The Public Works Department recommends contracting with two contractors for parkway tree
removal and emergency services. Services will be rendered and paid for based on the appropriate
seasonal rate group. A&B Landscaping and Tree Service, Inc, has completed this work for the
Village in a professional manner and is recommended to continue to provide the Village this
service. The contract for the other contractor, Dave Tree Care and Landscape, Inc., is under a
separate agenda item.

Alternatives
The Board can delay action to gain additional information.

Previous Board Action

The Village Board approved funding for the program as part of the FY2019 budget and has approved
tree removal contractor agreements annually.

https://oak-park.legistar.com/LegislationDetail.aspx?ID=4231671 &GUID=618DA084-4...  11/18/2019
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Citizen Advisory Commission Action
N/A.
Anticipated Future Actions/Commitments
It is anticipated that the Public Works Department will be bringing this agreement to the Village

Board annually.

Intergovernmental Cooperation Opportunities
None at this time

https://oak-park.legistar.com/LegislationDetail.aspx?ID=4231671&GUID=618DA084-4... 11/18/2019
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RESOLUTION

A RESOLUTION APPROVING THE RENEWAL OF AN INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR
AGREEMENT WITH A & B LANDSCAPING AND TREE SERVICE, INC. FOR
FISCAL YEAR 2020 PARKWAY TREE REMOVAL IN AN AMOUNT
NOT TO EXCEED $150,000.00 AND AUTHORIZING ITS EXECUTION

BE IT RESOLVED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village of Oak Park, Cook
County, State of illinois (“Village"}, in the exercise of their home rule powers, that the Renewal
of the Independent Contractor Agreement (“Renewal”) with A & B Landscaping and Tree
Service, Inc. of Riverside, lllinois, for fiscal year 2020 parkway tree removal is renewed in an
amount not to exceed $150,000.00 and the Village Manager is authorized to execute the

Renewal in substantially the form attached.

THIS RESOLUTION shall be in full force and effect from and after its adoption and

approval as provided by law.

ADOPTED this 18" day of November, 2018, pursuant to a roll call vote as follows:

Voting Aye Nay | Abstain Absent
President Abu-Taleb e
Trustee Andrews /
Trustee Boutet v
Trustee Buchanan v
Trustee Moroney v
Trustee Taglia v
Trustee Walker-Peddakotla v’
APPROVED this 18" day of November, 2018.
TN

Anan Abu-Taleb, Village President
ATTEST

_WrtiJrawmar

Vicki Scaman, Village Clerk



RES 19-339_R_111819

RENEWAL OF AN INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR AGREEMENT BETWEEN
THE VILLAGE OF OAK PARK AND A&B LANDSCAPING AND TREE SERVICE, INC.
FOR FY2020 PARKWAY TREE REMOVAL IN AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $150,000.00

THIS RENEWAL OF THE INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR AGREEMENT ({hereinafter
“Renewal”) between the Village of Oak Park, an lllincis home rule municipal corporation
(hereinafter the “Village”), and A & B Landscaping and Tree Service, Inc. {hereinafter the
“Contractor”) is entered into as of the effective date set forth below (collectively referred
to as the “Parties”).

RECITALS

WHEREAS, the Parties previously entered into an Independent Contractor Agreement
dated December 15, 2017 (“Agreement”); and

WHEREAS, the Parties seek to renew the Agreement in an amount not to exceed
$150,000.00.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the foregeing, and the mutual covenants and
agreements contained herein and other good and valuable consideration, the receipt and
sufficiency of which is acknowledged by the Parties, the Parties hereto agree as follows:

1. RECITALS INCORPORATED. The above recitals are incorporated herein as
though fully set forth,

2. RENEWAL OF AGREEMENT. The Agreement between the Parties is hereby
renewed from January 1, 2020 through December 31, 2020.

3. TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE AGREEMENT TO REMAIN IN EFFECT. Ali
terms and conditions of the Agreement shall be in full force and effect for the term of this
Renewal.

4, EFFECTIVE DATE. This Renewal shall be effective on the date of its execution
by the Village Manager of the Village of Oak Park.

[REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK —
SIGNATURE PAGE FOLLOWS]



IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused this Renewal to be signed by their
duly authorized representatives on the dates set forth below.

VILLAGE OF OAK PARK A & B LANDSCAPING AND TREE SERVICE,
INC.

By: Cara Pavlicek By:
Its:  Village Manager Its:%,éﬂ»&/
Dated: /ri; /f f , 2019 Dated: [/ - ZZ , 2019

ATTEST ATTEST

Vil b ’Tm/,—

By:  Vicki Scaman By:T,‘?_;Tf,.TJST, roule
Its: Village Clerk

Dated: / ///? , 2019 Dated: '/ 72 , 2019
REVEWERANBASFRSTR®
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“ORD’ CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE 11/21/2019

8 CERTIFICATE 1S ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
RTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
wOW, THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
PRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IORTANT: If the certificate holder Is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(les) must be endorsed. |f SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to
terms and conditions of the pollcy, certaln policies may require an andorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confar rights to the
tificats halder in Heu of such endorsement(s}.

JCER CORTACT
Rggicﬁ}; INSURANCE AGENCY PHONE " . (708) 447-1011 TR wep (708) 447-3716

anoress doug@stroheckerinsurance. com

verside, IL 60546

INSURER([B) AFFORDING COVERAGE MHAICS

msurer A Atlantic Casualty

ED A&B Landscaping and Tree Service Inc INSURER 8 ; PTOgressive

PO Box 344 wsurer ¢ . T@chnology Insurance Company

Riverside, IL 60546 INSURER D

INSURER E *

INSURER F

ERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

W
IS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
NCATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
RTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,

SLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

TYPE OF INSURANGE s POLICY NUMBER (Jﬁ'ﬁ'gfvmg' '1 -WWEEW) LMTS
X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE s 1,000,000
— -DARAGE TO RERTED
— | cramsace [ X] occur PREMISES (Ea cccurernce) |3 100,000
— 05/10/19 |05/10/20 | MEQEXP (Anyonoperson) 19 5,000
b4 1211002275 personaLaaovinuury |8 1,000,000
‘GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL Accrecate (s 2,000,000
poucy [ | SES: Loc PRODUCTS - compiop ace | s 2,000,000
__| oTuer: 5
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY C‘F_‘?, eCcient) $ 750,000
) BODILY INJURY (Per person) | §
ANYAUTO 2
] il.ul.rgngD X iﬁgriggULED 06161440 05/10/18 |05/10/20 BODILY INJURY (Per accident) [ $
- G "PROPERTY DANAGE
HIRED AUTOS 23#0%““ HM'JN M
. s
UMBRELLA LWB | | ocouR | EACH OCCURRENCE s
EXCESS LIAB CUAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE 3
DED RETENTION § s
WORKERS COMPENSATION X erhure | e
o peedsi e U R .| |4ees3230 04/18/19(04/18/20 (¢ Cacuaccment |5 100,000
e EL DISEASE -eAEmPLOvERs 100,000
gég’égfﬁﬁgfe%‘gaépemnous below E.L DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | § 500,000

RIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101. Additional Remarks Schedulo, may ba sttached if more spece is required)
additional insuraed: Village of Oak Park

iTIFICATE HOLOER

CANCELLATION

village of Oak Park
123 Madison St
Oak Park IL 60302

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELVERED N
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED BEFRESENTATIVE

R

T,

R ——

JRD25(2014/01)

© 1988-2014 ACORD CORPORATION. Al rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD




= ACSTAR

e INSURANCE COMPANY 30 SOU'TI ROAD » FARMINGTON. €T 06032 « TELEVIIONE: (860) 4158400

13

CONTINUATION CERTIFICATE

BOND NO:  F22738
ONBEHALF OF:  A&B LANDSCAPING AND TREE SERVICE, INC.

INFAVOROF: VILLAGE OF OAK PARK, IL

BOND AMOUNT:  $25,000.00

ACSTAR Insurance Company hereby agrees to continue said bond in force for the further
period:

Beginning on January 1, 2020
and

Continuing through December 31, 2020
All other terms and conditions remain unchanged.
Signed and sealed this 28" day of January, 2020,

ACSTAR Insurance Company

G4&fry W. Nozko, Jr. — President .7 " .
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Corporation/LLC Search/Certificate of Good Standing Page 1 of 3

Office of the Secretary of State Jesse White
CVBERIRIVEILLINOIS. COM

Corporation/LLC Search/Certificate of Good Standing

Corporation File Detail Report

File 68306213
Number

Entity A & BLANDSCAPING AND TREE SERVICE, INC.
Name

Status
ACTIVE

Entity Information
Entity Type
CORPORATION

Type of Corp
DOMESTIC BCA

Incorporation Date (Domestic)
Saturday, 7 January 2012

State
ILLINOIS

Duration Date
PERPETUAL

Agent Information

https://www.ilsos.gov/corporatellc/CorporateLlcController 1/28/2020
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Corporation/LLC Search/Certificate of Good Standing

Name
RICHARD M RANDICK, ATTORNEY A

Address
5300 MAIN ST STE A
DOWNERS GROVE, IL 60515

Change Date
Tuesday, 20 March 2012

Annual Report
Filing Date
Wednesday, 4 December 2019

For Year
2020

Officers

President
Name & Address
CYNTHIA RUSKA 5300 MAIN ST DOWNERS GROVE 60515

Secretary

Name & Address
CYNTHIA RUSKA 5300 MAIN ST DOWNERS GROVE 60515

Return to Search

File Annual Report

Adopting Assumed Name

Articles of Amendment Effecting A Name Change

Change _o_f Registered Agent and/or Registered Office

https://www.ilsos.gov/corporatellc/CorporateLicController

Page 2 of 3

{One Certificate per Transaction)

1/28/2020
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INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR AGREEMENT

THIS INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR AGREEMENT (“Contract”) is entered into on this

day of November, 2017, by and between the Village of Oak Park, an lllinois home rule
municipal corporation (hereinafter the “Village”), and A & B Landscaping and Tree Service, Inc.,
an lllinois Corporation (hereafter the “Contractor”).

WHEREAS, Cantractor submitted a Proposal dated September 15, 2017, a copy of which is
attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference, to provide Parkway Tree Removal
(hereinafter referred to as the "Work”) for the Village Comprehensive Tree Maintenance Program
(hereinafter referred to as the “Project”) pursuant to the Village's Request for Proposals dated
September 6, 2017, incorporated herein by reference as though fully set forth; and

WHEREAS, the Contractor represented in said Propasal that it has the necessary personnel,
experience, and competence to promptly complete the Project and the Work required hereunder
(hereinafter referred to as the “Work”); and

WHEREAS, Contractor shall perform the Work pursuant to the terms and canditions of this
Contract.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the premises and the mutual promises contained in
this Contract, and other good and valuable consideration received and to be received, it is
mutually agreed by and between the parties as follows:

1, RECITALS INCORPORATED
The above recitals are incorporated herein as though fuliy set forth.
2. SCOPE OF WORK

Contractor shall perform the Work for the Project in accordance with its Proposal for a
price not to exceed $190,000.00 {“Contract Price”). Contractor shall complete the Wark
in accordance with any applicable manufacturers’ warranties and in accordance with its
Proposal, the Village's Request for Proposals, and this Contract, all of which together
shall constitute the “Contract Documents.” The Contractor acknowledges that It has
inspected the site(s) where the Wark Is to be performed and that it is fully familiar with
all of the conditions at the site(s), and further that its Proposal has adequately taken
into consideration all of the conditions at the sites. Contractor hereby represents and
warrants that it has the skill and experience necessary to complete the Work in a good




and workmanlike manner in accordance with the Contract Documents, and that the
Work shall be free from defects. Contractor shall achieve completion of all work
required pursuant to the Contract Documents by December 31st, 2018 {"Contract
Time”). The Contract Time is of the essence. In the event the Contractor fails to
complete the Work on or before said date, the Village shall be entitled to liquidated
damages in the amount of $500.00 per day for each day the Work remains uncompleted
beyond the completion date set forth above. This amount is not a penalty, and the
parties agree to said amount given the difficulties associated with determining or
calculating damages to the Village in the event the Work is not completed on time.
Contractor shall have no claim for damages, for compensation in excess of the Contract
Price, or for a delay or extension of the Cantract Time based upon conditions found at,
or in the vicinity of, the site(s).

DESIGNATED REPRESENTATIVES

Contractor shall designate in writing a person to act as its designated representative
with respect to the Work to be performed under this Contract who shail have the power
and authority to make or grant or do all things, certificates, requests, demands,
approvals, consents, notices and other actions required that are ministerial in nature or
described in this Agreement for and on behalf of Contractor and with the effect of
binding Contractor. The Village is entitled to rely on the full power and authority of the
person executing this Cantract on behalf of Contractor as having been properly and
legally given by Contractor. Contractar shall have the right to change its designated
representative by providing the Village with written notice of such change which notice
shall be sent in accordance with Section 12 of this Agreement.

The Village's Director of Public Works or the Director’s designee shall be deemed the
Village's authorized representative for purposes of this Agreement, unless applicable
law requires action by the Corporate Authorities, and shall have the power and
authority to make or grant or do those things, certificates, requests, demands,
approvals, consents, notices and other actions required that are ministerial in nature or
described in this Agreement for and on behalf of the Village and with the effect of
binding the Village as limited by this Contract. Contractor is entitled to rely on the full
power and authority of the person executing this Agreement on behalf of the Village as
having been properly and legally given by the Village. The Village shall have the right to
change its authorized representative by providing Cantractor with written notice of such
change which notice shall be sent in accordance with Section 12 of this Agreement.

TERM OF CONTRACT

Contractor shall perform the Work pursuant to this Contract beginning on the effective
date as defined herein and ending on December 31, 2018 or as determined by the
Village. The Contractor shall invoice the Village for the Work provided pursuant to this



Contract at the rates set forth in its Proposal. The term of this Contract may be extended
in writing for one additional period of one year pursuant to the consent of the parties.

PAYMENT SCHEDULE

Contractor shall, as a condition precedent to its right to receive any payment, submit to the
Village an application for payment and such recelpts, vouchers, and other documents as
may be necessary to establish the Contractor's payment for all labor and material and the
absence of any interest whether in the nature of a lien or otherwise of any party in any
property, work, or fund with respect to the Work performed hereunder. Such documents
shallinclude, where relevant, the following forms, copies of which are attached hereto:

(i) Contractor's sworn statement;

(i) Contractar's partial or final waiver of lien;
{ii)  Subcontractor's sworn statement{s); and

{ivi  Subcontractor's partial or final waiver of lien.

Payment by the Village shall be conditioned upon an inspection by the Village of the
Work completed and submission of required waivers by the Contractor. Payment by the
Village shall in no way constitute a walver of, or relieve the Contractor from, any defects
in the work. Al payments shall be made in accordance with the Ilinois Local
Government Prompt Payment Act, 50 ILCS 505/1 et seq. Final payment for any Work
performed by the Contractar pursuant to an invoice by Contractor shall be made by the
Village to the Contractor when Contractor has fully performed the work and the work
has been approved by the Village and submission of required walvers and paperwork by
Contractor. Approval of the work and issuance of the final payment by the Village shall
not constitute a waiver of, or release Contractor from, any defects in the work.

The Village shall have the right to withhold from any payment due hereunder such amount
as may reasonably appear necessary to compensate the Village for any actual or
prospective loss due to Work which is defective or does not confarm to the Contract
Dacuments; damage for which Contractor is liable hereunder; liens or claims of liens;
claims of third parties, subcontractors, or material men; or any failure of the Contractor to
perform any of its obligations under this Contract. The Village may apply any money
withheld or due Contractor hereunder to reimburse itseff for any and all costs, expenses,
losses, damages, liabilities, suits, judgments, awards, and attarney's fees incurred,
suffered, or sustained by the Village and chargeable to Contractor,

TERMINATION

The Village may terminate this Contract for cause, which includes but is not necessarily
limited to, the Contractor’s failure to perform the work pursuant to this Contract. The
Village shall provide the Contractor with five (5) days’ written notice of a termination for
cause pursuant to the provisions of Section 12 beiow. The Village may also terminate




this Contract when it determines the same to be in its best interests by giving fourteen
(14) days’ written notice to Contractor pursuant to the provisions of Section 12 below.
In such event, the Village shall pay to Contractor all amounts due for the work
performed up to the date of termination.

COMPLIANCE WITH APPLICABLE LAWS

Contractor shall comply with all applicable laws, regulations, and rules promulgated by
any federal, state, county, municipal and/ar other governmental unit or regulatory body
now in effect during the performance of the work. By way of example only and not as a
limitation, the following are included within the scape of the laws, regulations and rules
with which the Contractor must comply: all forms of workers’ compensation Laws, all
terms of the equal employment opportunity rules and regulations of the Illinois
Department of Human Rights, statutes refating to contracts let by units of government,
and all applicable civil rights and anti-discrimination faws and regulations.

INDEMNIFICATION

To the fullest extent permitted by law, Contractor shall waive any right of contribution
agalnst the Village and shall indemnify and hold harmless the village and its officers,
officials, employees, volunteers and agents from and against all claims, damages, losses
and expenses, including, but not limited to, legal fees (attorney’s and paralegal’s fees,
expert fees and court costs} arising out of or resulting from the performance of the
Contractor's work, provided that any such claim, damage, loss or expense is attributable
to bodily injury, sickness, disease or death, or injury to or destruction of property, other
than the work itself, including the loss of use resulting therefrom, or is attributable to
misuse or improper use of trademark or copyright-protected matesial or otherwise
protected intellectual property, to the extent it is caused in whole or in part by any
wrongful or negligent act or omission of Contractor, any subcontractor, anyone directly
or indirectly employed by any of them or anyone for whose acts any of them may be
liable. Such obligation shall not be construed to negate, abridge or otherwise reduce
any other right to indemnity which the Village would otherwise have. Contractor shall
similarly protect, indemnify and hold and save harmless, the Village, its officers, officials,
employees, volunteers and agents against and from any and all claims, costs, causes,
actions and expenses, including, but not limited to, legal fees incurred by reason of the
Contractor’s breach of any of its obligations under, or Contractor's default of, any
provisions of this Contract. The indemnification obligations under this Section shall not
be limited in any way by any limitation on the amount or type of damages,
compensation, or benefits payable by er for the Contractor or any subcontractor under
Workers' Compensation or Disability Benefit Acts or Employee Benefit Acts.



INSURANCE

Contractor shall at Contractor's expense secure and maintain in effect throughout the
duration of this Contract, insurance of the following kinds and limits set forth in this
Section. Contractor shall furnish “Certificates of Insurance” to the Village before
beginning work on the Project pursuant to this Contract. All insurance policies shall be
written with insurance companies licensed to do business in the State of lllinols and
having a rating of at least A according to the latest edition of the Best's Key Rating
Guide; and shall include a provision preventing cancellation of the insurance policy
unless thirty (30) days prior written notice is given to the Village. This provision shall
also be stated on each Certificate of Insurance: "Should any of the above described
policies be canceled before the expiration date, the issuing company shall mail fifteen
thirty (30) days written notice to the certificate holder named to the left.”

The limits of liability for the insurance required shall provide coverage for not less than the
following amounts, or greater where required by law:

(A) Commercial General Liability:

i Coverage to include Broad Form Property Damage, Contractual and
Personal Injury.

ii. Limnits:
General Aggregate $ 2,000,000.00
Each Occurrence $1,000,000.00
Personal Injury $ 1,000,000.00

iil. Coverage for all claims arising out of the Contractor's operations or

premises and anyone directly or indirectly emptoyed by the Contractor.
(@) Workers’ Compensation:

i Workers’ compensation insurance shall be provided in accordance
with the provisions of the laws of the State of Hlinols, including occupational
disease provisions, for all employees who perform the Work pursuant to
this Contract, and if work is subcontracted pursuant to the provisions of this
Contract, Contractor shail require each subcontractor similarly to provide
workers’ compensation insurance. In case employees engaged in
hazardous work under this Contract are not protected under the Workers'
Compensation Act, Contractor shall provide, and shall cause each
subcontractor to provide, adequate and suitable insurance for the
protection of employees not otherwise provided.



10.

Q) Comprehensive Automobile Liability:

. Comprehensive Automobile Liability coverage shall include all
owned, hired, non-owned vehicles, and/or trailers and other equipment
required to be licensed, covering personal injury, bodily injury and property
damage.

ii. Limits:
Combined Single Limit $1,000,000.00

{D) Umbrella;

1. Limits:
Each Occurrence/Aggregate
$5,000,000.00

(€} The Village, its officers, officials, employees, agents and volunteers shall
be named as additional insureds on all insurance policies set forth herein except Workers’
Compensation. The Contractor shall be responsible for the payment of any deductibles for
said insurance polides. The coverage shall contain no special limitations on the scope of
protection afforded to the Village, its officers, officials, emplayees, agents, and volunteers.

(F) Contractor understands and agrees that any insurance protection
required by this Contract or otherwise provided by Contractor, shall in no way limit the
responsibility to indemnify, keep and save harmless, and defend the Village, its officers,
officials, employees, agents and volunteers as herein provided. Contractor waives and
shall have its insurers waive, its rights of subrogation against the Village, its officers,
officials, employees, agents and volunteers.

GUARANTY

Contractor warrants and guarantees that its Work provided for the Project to be
performed under this Contract, and all workmanship, materials, equipment, and supplies
performed, furnished, used, or installed under this Contract, performed, furnished, used,
or installed under this Contract, shall be free from defects and flaws in workmanship or
design; shall strictly conform to the requirements of this Contract; and shall be fit and
sufficient for the purposes expressed in, or reasonably inferred from, this Contract.
Contractor further warrants and guarantees that the strength of all parts of all
manufactured materials, equipment, and supplies shall be adequate and as specified and
that the performance requirements of this Contract shall be fulfilled.

Contractor shall, at no expense to the Village, correct any failure to fulfill the above
guaranty that may appear at any time. In any event, the guaranty herein expressed shall



11,

12,

13,

14,

not be sole and exclusive, and Is additional to any other guaranty or warranty expressed or
implied.

AFFIDAVIT OR CERTIFICATE

Contractor shall furnish any affidavit or certificate in connection with the work covered
by this Contract as required by law,

NOTICES

Any notice required to be given by this Contract shall be deemed sufficient if made in
writing and sent by certified mail, return receipt requested, by personal service, or by emai
transmission to the persons and addresses Indicated below or to such addresses and
persons as either party hereto shall notify the other party of in writing pursuant to the
provisions of this Section:

To the Village: To Contractor;

Village Manager AJ Ruska

Village of Qak Park A & B Landscape and Tree Service
123 Madison St. P.0. Box 344

Oak Park, lllinois 60302-4272 Riverside, IL 60546

Email: villagemanager@oak-park.us Email: aandblandscaping@msn.com

Mailing of such notice as and when above provided shall be equivalent to personal
notice and shall be deemed to have been given at the time of mailing.

Naotice by email transmission shall be effective as of date and time of transmission,
provided that the notice transmitted shall be sent on business days during business
hours (9:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. Chicago time}. In the event email notice is transmitted
during non-business hours, the effective date and time of notice is the first hour of the
first business day after transmission.

AUTHORITY TO EXECUTE

The individuals executing this Contract on behalf of Contractor and the Village represent
that they have the fegal power, right, and actual authority to bind their respective
parties to the terms and conditions of this Contract.

EFFECTIVE DATE

The effective date of this Contract as refiected above and below shall be the date that
the Village Manager executes this Contract on behalf of the Village.
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ENTIRE CONTRACT; APPROVAL OF SUBCONTRACTORS

This Contract, including the documents incorporated by reference herein, sets forth the
entire Contract between the parties with respect to the accomplishment of the Work. No
right or interest in this Contract shall be assigned, in whole or In part, by either party
without the prior written consent of the other party. The Village reserves the right to
approve the use of subcontractors to complete any portion of the Work and to approve
any applicable contract between the Contractor and a proposed subcontractor to perform
any of the Work. This Contract shall be binding upon the parties and upon their respective
heirs, executors, administrators, personal representatives, successors, and assigns, except
as herein provided.

INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR

Contractor shall have the full control of the ways and means of performing the Work
referred to above and that the Contractor and its employees, representatives or
subcontractors are not employees of the Village, it being specifically agreed that the
Contractor bears the relationship of an independent contractor to the Village. The
Contractor shall solely be responsible for the payment of all salaries, benefits and costs
of supplying personnel for the Work.

CONTRACT BOND

Before commencing the work on the Project, Contractor shall furnish a Contract Bond.
The Contract Bond shall be in an amount of twenty-five thousand dollars ($25,000.00} as
security for the faithful performance of its obligations pursuant to the Contract
Documents and as security for the payment of all persons performing labor and
furnishing materials in connection with the Contract Documents. Such bond shall be on
a standard AlA document, shall be issued by a surety satisfactory to the Village, and shall
name the Village as a primary co-obligee. The Contract Bond shall become a part of the
Contract Documents. The failure of Contractor to supply the required Contract Bond
within ten (10} days after the Notice of Award or within such extended period as the
Village may grent if the Contract Bond does not meet its approvai shall constitute a
default, and the Village may either award the Contract to the next lowest responsible
proposer or re-advertise for proposals. A charge against Contractor may be made for
the difference between the amount of Contractor’s Proposal and the amount for which
a contract for the Work is subsequently executed, irrespective of whether the amount
thus due exceeds the amount of the bid guarantee.
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GOVERNING LAW AND VENUE

This Contract shall be governed by the laws of the State of lliinois both as to
interpretation and performance. Venue for any action pursuant ta this Contract shall be
in the Circuit Court of Cook County, Illinois.

AMENDMENTS AND MODIFICATIONS

This Contract may be modified or amended from time-to-time provided, however, that
no such amendment or modification shall be effective unless reduced to writing and
duly authorized and signed by the authorized representative of the Village and the
authorized representative of the Contractor.

NON-WAIVER OF RIGHTS

No failure of either party to exercise any power given to it hereunder or to insist upon
strict compliance by the other party with its obligations hereunder, and no custom or
practice of the parties at variance with the terms hereof, nor any payment under this
Contract shall constitute a waiver of elther party's right to demand exact compliance
with the terms hereof,

CONFLICT

In case of a conflict between any provision{s} of the Village's Request for Propasals or
the Contractor’s Proposal and this Contract, this Contract and the Village's Request for
Proposals shall control to the extent of such conflict.

HEADINGS AND TITLES

The headings and titles provided in this Contract are for convenience only and shall not
he deemed a part of this Cantract.

COOPERATION OF THE PARTIES

The Village and Contractor shall cooperate in the provision of the Work to be provided
by Contractor pursuant to this Contract and in compliance with applicable laws,
including, but not limited to, the Jllinois Freedom of Information Act, S ILCS 140/1 et seq.
(“FOIA®), and the provision of any documents and information pursuant to a FOIA
request. Contractor shall provide any and all responsive documents to the Village
pursuant to a FOIA request at no cost to the Village.
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CERTIFIED PAYROLL

Contractor shall be solely responsible to maintain accurate records reflecting its payroll
for its employees who perfarm any of the Work for the Village pursuant to this Contract
and shall submit certified payroli records to the Village's Director of Public Works at any
time during the term of this Contract. Contractor shall provide said certified payroll
records within seven (7) days upon the request of the Director of Public Works.

COUNTERPARTS; FACSIMILE OR PDF SIGNATURES

This Contract may be executed in counterparts, each of which shall be considered an
original and together shall be one and the same Contract. A facsimile or pdf copy of this
Agreement and any signature(s) thereon will be considered for all purposes as an
original.

STANDARD OF CARE

Contractor shall endeavor to perform the Work with the same skill and judgment which
can be reasonably expected from similarly situated firms or entities.

(REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK -
SIGNATURE PAGE FOLLOWS]
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the partles hereto have caused this Contract to be signed by their
duly authorized representatives on the dates set forth below.

VILLAGE OF OAK PARK A & B LANDSCAPING AND TREE SERVICE,
By: Cara Pavlicek Bv (’

ts:  Village Manager Its: 7.

pate:_De¢ /5~ 2017 Date: /R - / 7 - 2017

ATTEST ATTEST

By:  Vicki Scaman By:

Its:  Village Clerk Its:

Date: _Der. /5 2017 Date: , 2017

11




[ I -7 7%] ABBTreeSenvkeinc. Davis Tree Care Inc. Kramer Tree Experts Inc. TheCareolTrealnc, | — Winkler Treelnc,
Unit Untt Unit Unit | Unit
No. BH B |
o DB Est Price Towalbyclass § o Towlbychass | oo 0 Totalbychss | oo Total by class peice_| T_n_t_al by class
1 6" -12" 1213 Na Bid Mu Bld 625005 3032500 | NoBid No Bid $71.96 | S 8704488 535.00 S5 42,455.00
H 12.3°20° 1415 Ho Biid No Bid ¢4B00 | S 6792000 | NoBid NoBid 1 59523 i_ 134,778 75 | 87500 1§ 111785.00
E} 20.1-30" 777 No Bid No Bld 57500 | $ 5827500 | NoBid 8id | No Bid 6144.56) 5 112.323.12 512_4-.&)"!_1 96,348 00
4 | 30.1" and Over pF13 No Bid Na Bid 49500 | &  21,47000] No “No Bid No Bid 5372 74 | S £4.239.24 §5148 po{§ 33144800
Total]l. 15 N | S 172,990.00 15 . TS amp3ssss |l 15 284036500
0 o
2 men Chipper truck w/chipper NoBid B $240.00 Ho Bid 512000 $250.00
1 man Acrial Lift Truck] NoBld B §335.00 Ho Bid _ 559500 £175.00
1 rman Log Loader Nobid $135.00 - No Bid 5125.00 515000
1 man Semt Tractor-Urafler No Bld o 5135.00 - Ne@d $150.00 $175.00
Labores No Bid 510500 No Bid 595.00 5100.00
D1EB R o
"""" 2 i YA T:ee Sewlcg_!rlc_ _ Davis Tree Lare . | Kramerrae Experts Ing. TheCare of Tree Inc, Winkler Tree Ing.
No. DBH :‘: Est. 8 |Bid Price, Totatbyclass |8id FE Totalby class |Bld Price| Totalby ¢lass |Bid Price] Total by class lmd Pri:eJ Tota! by class
1 =N 5 | 20 | $300 | § " cappo0| 5400 (& 72000 NaBid | NoBid ~ | NoBd} WNoBid NoBid | NoBid
2 11.1°18° 16 | 60 | 5750 !5 7.200.00 _‘S_B.DD § 7.680.00 | NoBid Np 8id Na Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid
3 1B.1"-24" 215| 65 |51100 | § 153725051300 !5 18,167.50 | No Bid No@id | No fld Noflid | No Bid ! No Bid
2| 28120° |265] 40 _} 51300 | 5 13,78000 | 51500 § 1550000 | NoBid | HoBid No Bid No Bid NoBld | NaBid
5[ 3013 |325[ 10 |61700,5 552500 $i00| § 585000 | WoBid | NoBid N Bid Nobid | NoBid | NoBd _
[ 13_6.1'- a1 10 _517.!)0 I5 637000 | 52000 & .200.00 I i No 8id No Bid .H_oﬂld No Bid
Totall 15 45,387.50|" 1§ se51750 1 . 5 - I S -
18 »)
2en3TETAE ] A&B Ttea envice Ing. Davls Trca Carelnc. | Kramer Tree Expents Inc. The Care of Tree Inc. Winkler Tree Inc,
No. DBH AD‘:: Est. ula!d Price’ Total by class ' i Prlu Tonal by ctass |Bid Price' Total by class ]Bld Price| Totalby class lald Price] Total by chass
1 0n11" 9 | 20 | 5750 |5 135000} 5250 | S 45000 NoBld | HoBid Ne Bid Mo 8id No Bid No Bid
2 11.1%-18" 16 | 30 51] 508 552000 | 51400 | 5 6,720.00 | No Bld No Bid No Bld No 8!d Na Bid No Bid
3| 28124 | 21| 65 | 51950 (S 2661750 521005  28.663.00| NoBld Bid |~ NoBd | NoBid Mo Bid No Bid tio Bid
4 24 1*-30° 7 55 § 523.00 § 3415500} 52500!5 3212500 | No Bid No fig Nagid | Nofid | No Bid | No Bld
5 30.1°-36" 33 | 60 152850 5 5643000] 52000 % 5742000 ) Ho Bid | No Bid No Bld No Bld No Bid NoBld
& 361" 4] 40 | 53500 | 5 57,400.00 | 537.00 S 60,.660.00 N_o_B‘i_d " noeid No Bid Ng Bid No Bid Na Bid
Total! TS 18147250 |0 . 1§ 191.060.001° il 5 = i S -
C18 o H P ¢
2 men Chipper truck w/thippes 18000 | 524000 _NoBid o Ho Bid No Bid
1 man Aerlal Uft Truck $120.00 . 5135.00 tio Bld No Bid _ NoBid
1 maniog Loader| $120.00 $135.00 _NoBid . No Bid ___NoBid
1 man Sernl Tractos-tealler] 512000 | 513500 “NoBid No Bid No Bid
Labarer 550.00 $105.00 No Bld No Bld No Bid
0ig 0 R 0
[ s il AR BireeServiceiIng, Dravis Tree Care Inc. Kramer Tree Expents Inc. The Care of Tree Inc. winkler Tipe lnc,
No.[ GiindType Est. ¥ |Bid Price Total Bid Price Total Bld Price) Total Bid Price] Total |8id Price} Tota!
1 Full Grind 650 5246.00| § 159,900.00 [$325.00) 5 211.250.00 | No Bid No Eld No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld
0187 H o] e} [+ i
Parkway Restoration with Sod) $10.00 £350.00 No 8id No Bid No Bld
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B CORPORATION FlLE DETAIL REPORT

|l File liumber | 68308213
'l Enfity Name | A & B LANDSCAPNG AND TREE SERVICE INC
' Status | AcTvE

Enmy Type | CORPORATION Type of Corp DOMESTIC BCA
Incorporation Date. 01/07/2012 | state ILLINOIS

{Domestic} { {

'Ag'eht-!_l_am_’e_- | RICHARD 1§ RANDICK, | Agent Ghange Date 0372012012
| | ATTORMEY A | : :
[ Ag ent sireei*Address ‘ 5300 MAN ST STEA l President Hame& CYHTHIA K AUSKA 53060

.{I 5 -Addreéss | MAIN ST DOWHERS GROVE
L ! VEERTA, | 60515
. i-ﬁ‘ﬁéﬁi'gtﬁf | | DOWIERS GROVE | _secraiary Hame & ' SAME

! Addresu _
 Agent Zip 60515 ' Duration Date PERPETUAL
- Annual Report Filing 12/08/201€ Far Year 2017

Date
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Agenda ltem Summary
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File #: RES 1 -TOB?Uerslon: 1

Submitted By
John P. Wielebnicki, Director of Public Works

Reviewed By
CLP

Agenda item Title

A Resolution Approving an Independent Contractor Agreement with A & B Landscaping and Tree Service,
Inc. for Fiscal Year 2018 Parkway Tree Removal in an Amount not to Exceed $190,000.00 and Authorizing its
Execution

Overview

The Village has over 18,000 public trees on parkways and in other public spaces. Each year a portion of those
trees need to be removed due to disease {Dutch elm disease), insect infestation {(Emerald ash borer), storm
damage and senescence. The Village contracts for these services through a year-long contract that bill at
different rates depending on the season. Tree removal contractors are also called on to provide emergency
services such as starm damage clean-up and emergency tree removal.

Staff Recommendation
Approve the Resolution.

Fiscal Impact
The proposed FY 2018 budget recommends 3 total of $350,000.00 for Parkway Tree Removal and $50.000.00
for Storm Clean-up in the General Fund, External Support account no. 1001-43800-741-530667.

Background

The majority of tree removals within the Village have historically been contracted out. Tree remaoval contracts
assist the village in a number of ways. They reduce loss by allowing staff to focus on identification of diseased
trees and preventive care. They reduce liability by allowing contractors with appropriate equipment and staff
to remove larger trees. Lastly, they enhance in-house customer service by enabling crews to respond to
pruning and other requests more quickly and efficiently.

In 2013, the village began to bid out two separate season rate groups for removal. The development of these
winter removal rates has resulted in significant cost saving for the village.

A&B Landscaping and Tree Service, Inc. and Davis Tree Care, Inc. were the low and second low bidder in the
summer and winter rate groups.

Experience over the last several years has determined that a single contractor can have difficulty keeping pace
with removals and storm damage demands, especially if weather conditions for the season are severe. Staff

Village of Oak Park Page 10(2 Printed on 12/1172017
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RESOLUTION

A RESOLUTION APPROVING AN INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR AGREEMENT WITHA & B
LANDSCAPING AND TREE SERVICE, INC. FOR FISCAL YEAR 2018 PARKWAY TREE REMOVAL
IN AN AMOUNT NOT TO EXCEED $190,000.00 AND AUTHORIZING ITS EXECUTION

BE IT RESOLVED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village of Oak Park, Cook
County, State of lllinois (“Village”), in the exercise of their home rule powers, that the
Independent Contractor Agreement (“Agreement”) with A & B Landscaping and Tree Service,
Inc. for fiscal year 2018 Parkway Tree Removal Services is approved in an amount not to exceed
$190,000.00 and the Village Manager is authorized to execute the Agreement in substantially
the form attached.

THIS RESOLUTION shall be in full force and effect from and after its adoption and
approval as provided by law.

ADOPTED this 11" day of December, 2017, pursuant to a roll call vote as follows:

Nay Abstain Absent

~
11

Voting A
President Abu-Taleb
Trustee Andrews
Trustee Boutet
Trustee Button
Trustee Moroney
Trustee Taglia
Trustee Tucker

NN NS

APPROVED this 11" day of December, 2017,

Anan Abu-Taleb, Village President

ATTEST

=8

Vicki Scaman, Village Clerk
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RESOLUTION

A RESOLUTION APPROVING AN INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR AGREEMENT WITHA & B
LANDSCAPING AND TREE SERVICE, INC. FOR FISCAL YEAR 2018 PARKWAY TREE REMOVAL
IN AN AMQUNT NOT TO EXCEED $190,000.00 AND AUTHORIZING ITS EXECUTION

BE IT RESOLVED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village of Oak Park, Cook
County, State of lllinois (“Village”), in the exercise of their home rule powers, that the
Independent Contractor Agreement (“Agreement”) with A & B Landscaping and Tree Service,
Inc. for fiscal year 2018 Parkway Tree Removal Services is approved in an amount not to exceed
$190,000.00 and the Village Manager is authorized to execute the Agreement in substantially
the form attached.

THIS RESOLUTION shall be in full force and effect from and after its adoption and
approval as provided by law.

ADOPTED this 11" day of December, 2017, pursuant to a roll call vote as follows:

Voting A
President Abu-Taleb
Trustee Andrews
Trustee Boutet
Trustee Button
Trustee Moroney
Trustee Taglia
Trustee Tucker

Nay Abstain Absent

~
13
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APPROVED this 11" day of Decem/ber,jﬂl-?—.//

O\//f——-—

Anan Abu-Taleb, Village President

ATTEST

M.Z ( Shproan

Vicki Scaman, Village Clerk
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CONTRACT BOND
9
.qp“
o= =
oak Park Contract Bond
AR Landecaping and Trase Service. Inc., as PRINCIPAL, and ACSTAR Insurance Company as

SURETY, are held and firmly bound unto the Village of Oak Park (hereafter referred to as “Village®) In the
penal sum of _Twenty Five Thousand 00/100 dollars ($25,000) , well and truly to be paid to
the Village, for the payment of which Its heirs, executors, adminlstrators, successors and asslgns, are
hound Jolntly to pay to the Viltage under the conditlons of this instrument.
aole Parkway Tree Removal

WHEREAS, THE CONDITION OF THE FOREGOING OBLIGATION IS SUCH that, the Principal has entered
Into a written contract with the Village, acting through its President and Board of Trustees, far the
construction of work, which contract Is hereby referred to and made a part hereof as If wrltten herein at
length, and whereby the Princlpal has promised and agreed to perform the work in accordance with the
terms of the contract, and has promised to pay all sums of money due for any labor, materials,
apparatus, fixtures or machinery furnished to such Principal for the purpose of performing such work,
including paying not Jess than the prevalling rate of wages In Cook County, where the work Is for the
construction of any public work subject ta the Prevailing Wage Act, and has further agreed to save and
indemnify and keep harmless the Village against all liabifltles, judgments, costs and expenses which may
In any manner accrue against the Village in consequence of granting such contract or which may In any
manner result from the carelessness or neglect of the Princlpal, his agents, employees or workmen In
any respect whatever; and has further agreed that this bond will Inure to the benefit of any person, firm,
company, or corporation, to whom any money may be due from the Principal, subcontractor or
otherwise, for any such labor, materlals, apparatus, fixtures or machinery so furnished and that suit may
be maintalned on such bond by any such person, fltm, company, or corparation, for the recovery of any

such money.

NOW THEREFORE, If the Principal shall well and truly perform the work in accordance with the terms of
the contract, and shall pay all sums of money due or to become due for any labor, materials, apparatus,
fixtures or machinery furnished to It for the purpase of constructing such work, and shall commence and
complete the wark within the time prescribed In the contract, and shall pay and discharge all damages,
direct and Indirect, that may be suffered or sustained on account of such work during the time of
performance thereof and until the work shall have been accepted, and shall save and Indemnify and
keep harmless the Village against all liabllities, judgments, costs and expenses which may In any manner
accrue against the Viltage In consequence of granting such contract or which may in any manner result
from the carelessness or neglect of the Princlpal, his agents, employees or workmen In any respect
whatever; and shall in all respects fully and faithfully comply with all the provisions, conditiens, and
requirements of the contract, then this obligation will be void; otherwise it will remaln In full force and
effect.
Thie bond ig For a twelve month duration and non-renewal shall not be &n event of default. Bond shall

exclude any lons Incurred by Obligee or others subsequent to bond expiration and excludes any
The obligation incurred during bond period shall only apply to

reprocurement cost or expenses.
Renewal premiumso are due 30 days prior to any renewal date.

rovenue earned during che bond periocd.



A&B Landscaping apnd Tree Service, Tnc Bond No. . 22758

Not valid for morigage, ncte, loan, letter of credit, bank deposit, currancy

rara, Inleras! rats or residual value guaranlees

POWER OF ATTORNEY

No. 36661

30 SOUTH ROAD « FARMINTTOH, CF 00037 - {#0) 318840

This Power of Attornay must havo original corporate saal and red and blue ACSBTAR logo to ba valld.

Know all man by thase prosents: Thal ACSTAR Insurance Company. 8 comporation of tha State of Hfinois, having its ptincipal
office n the Town of Farminglon, Connecticat, pursuant 1o the following Resclution, which was adopled by the Board of Direclors of the sald

Company on November 14, 2013, to wil:

RESOLVED, Thal the folowing Rulas shell govem the execution for the Company of bonds, undorakings, recognizances.
caniracis and other wrilings In Jhe nature thereal:

(1)  That the Chalrman, the Presidant, Exscutive Vica Prasidant and Genoral Counsel, or any Atlomeyin-fact, may axacute for end an
bahatf of the Company any and all bands, underakings, mcognlzances, contracis and other wiilings in the nature therecf, the sama
to be shasted when nocessary by tha Corporate Secrelary, or any Assistani Comorate Secaiary, and the seatl of the Company
affixed therelo; and that the Chairman or Presidenl may appalnt and authorize any othar Officer (efaciad or appointed) of the
Company, and Attomeys-n-Fact (o so execule or attest o the aexsculion of afl such wrilings on bahalf of the Company and 10 aHix the

saal of the Company therelo.

{2)  Any such wiling executed in accordence with {hesa Rules shall ba s binding upon the Company In any case as though signed by
the President and attasied to by the Corparale Secretary,

{3) Tha sighature of the Chalnman, the Prasidant. o Execullve Vica Presidant of the Company may ba affixed by facsimila on any power
of attornay grantad pursuant to this Rasolution, and tha signalure of 8 facskmila lo any certificale of any such pawer, and any such
power or certificale baaring such facsimila signature and seal shall be valid and binding on the Company.

{4) Such other Officers of the Company, and Atomeys-in-Fact ehall havs authority to cedify or verify coples of this Resclulion, tha
By-Lews of the Company, and any afidavit o racord of the Company necessary 1o the discharge of tholr duties.

doas heteby nominate, constitute and appolnt

HENRY W. NOZKD, JR., HENRY W. NOZKO W, GARY M. CASE, CARMEN CARLTON, each individually, ils true and lawiul
Attarney-in-fact, tn maks, axactre, sa2l and delivar on s bohal, and as is act end deed eny and all bonds, undartakings, recognizancas,
contracls and other wiilings In the nature thareof Ln panatias not exceading TEN MULION DOLLARS ($10,000,000,00) each, and the
axecution of such wiitings in pursuance of these prasants, shall be as binding upan sald Company, as fully and amply, as |l they had been
duly exaculed and acknowiadged by the regularty electad officors of tho Company &t its principal office.

1N WITNESS WHEREGF, Hanry W, Nozko, Jr., Fresident, have hareunto subscribed hiz name and afiixod the corporats seal of tha
ACSTAR INSURANCE COMPANY Lhls 15™ day of November 2013
ACSTAR Insurance Company

e,WWQ“ )

STATE OF CONNECTICUT) fionry W Wozko, Jr, Phedident
} 63. FARMINGTON

COUNTY OF HARTFORD )

On this 16" day of Novembsr A.D. 2013, befora me, a Notary Public of the Stale of Connecticul came, Henry W. Nazko, Jr,
President of the ACSTAR Insurance Company, lo me pgrsonally known {o be the Individual and officer who executed the pmcading
lnstument, and ha acknowledged thal ha executed the same, end the soal aflived 1o the preceding Instrument is the corperala seal of said
Company; that the sald corporale seal and his signaturs was duly affixed by the sutherity and direction of Ihe sald carporation, and the
Rexolution adoplad by the Board of Directors of said Company, refarred lo in the preceding Instrument, is now In force.

{N TESTIMONY WHEREOE, | hava hereunlo sel my hand and affixed my official seal at tha Town of Farminglon the day and ysar
firnt sbova writlen. UL
2

B, Aiane, &.Flaste

Diane L. Planie - Notary Public
My Commission Expiration Dale: November 30, 2018

0., oA,
7, o
g NEETVE
TN
I, the undersigned, Secratary or Assistant Secralary of AGSTAR Insurance Campany, do hereby certtly that tha original POWER CF
ATTORNEY of which the foregaing is & full, true and caroct copy, bs in full force and effact.

In witnass whereo!, | have herounto subscribed my nama as Secretary or Assislanl Secratary, and shixed the corporato sotl of the
Corporation, this 1 2Ehdayof _January ,_2018. :

Harey W. Nozko HiMaurica C. Shea
Secrelary/Assisiant Secrelary




Bond No. F22758B

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the PRINCIPAL and the SURETY have caused this Instrument te be signed by
their respective officers this _12ch day of _ January , 2018,

Printed Name

tle

Subscribed to and Sworn before me on the

{

// Zﬁday of j it a/u,/ /)2018. : "OFFIGIAL SEAL” * :
LL/LL thelte /&4_ len /,(4 g/cc\ i MICHELLE BULIR litllls“ml i
Notary Public ; - ré%%';:‘g‘;c-gfﬁ:& 102772021 3
NAME OF SURETY

ACSTAR Ipourance Company
By: -
“u{'re of Attorney-in-Fact Menry W. Nozko, Jr. - President

Subscribed to and Sworn before me on the

12th day of Janusry . 2018.
Na‘larv Public

HEATHER L. SOBOTKA
NOTARY PURLIC
Y COMMISSION EXPIRES OCT, 31, 2010

-



	Attachment 1
	Attachment 2

