
No. D.B.H Unit Price Total by class Unit Price Total by class Unit Price Total by class Unit Price Total by class Unit Price Total by class Unit Price Total by class
1 1" - 4" No Bid No Bid $10.00 11,400.00$            $15.00 17,100.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.00 13,680.00$        
2 4.1" - 6" No Bid No Bid $18.00 10,638.00$            $25.00 14,775.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.00 13,002.00$        
3 6.1" - 12" No Bid No Bid $35.00 50,610.00$            $25.00 36,150.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.00 60,732.00$        
4 12.1" - 20" No Bid No Bid $90.00 163,890.00$          $48.00 87,408.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $80.00 145,680.00$      
5 20.1"-30" No Bid No Bid $195.00 227,565.00$          $75.00 87,525.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $150.00 175,050.00$      
6 30.1" and Over No Bid No Bid $580.00 201,260.00$          $95.00 32,965.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $210.00 72,870.00$        

-$                    665,363.00$          275,923.00$      -$                    -$                    481,014.00$      

No. D.B.H Avg 
Dia

Est. # Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class

1 0"-11" 9 20 $3.00 540.00$             No Bid No Bid $4.00 720.00$             No Bid No Bid $14.50 $2,610.00 No Bid No Bid
2 11.1"-18" 16 60 $7.50 7,200.00$          No Bid No Bid $8.00 7,680.00$          No Bid No Bid $17.00 $16,320.00 No Bid No Bid
3 18.1"-24" 21 60 $11.00 13,860.00$        No Bid No Bid $13.00 16,380.00$        No Bid No Bid $19.00 $23,940.00 No Bid No Bid
4 24.1"-30" 27 40 $13.00 14,040.00$        No Bid No Bid $15.00 16,200.00$        No Bid No Bid $20.00 $21,600.00 No Bid No Bid
5 30.1"-36" 33 10 $17.00 5,610.00$          No Bid No Bid $18.00 5,940.00$          No Bid No Bid $22.00 $7,260.00 No Bid No Bid
6 36.1"- 41 10 $17.00 6,970.00$          No Bid No Bid $20.00 8,200.00$          No Bid No Bid $22.00 $9,020.00 No Bid No Bid

48,220.00$        -$                        55,120.00$        -$                    80,750.00$        -$                    

No. D.B.H Avg 
Dia

Est. # Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class

1 0"-11" 9 20 $7.50 1,350.00$          No Bid No Bid $2.50 450.00$             No Bid No Bid $14.50 $2,610.00 No Bid No Bid
2 11.1"-18" 16 50 $11.50 9,200.00$          No Bid No Bid $14.00 11,200.00$        No Bid No Bid $19.00 $15,200.00 No Bid No Bid
3 18.1"-24" 21 60 $19.50 24,570.00$        No Bid No Bid $21.00 26,460.00$        No Bid No Bid $21.00 $26,460.00 No Bid No Bid
4 24.1"-30" 27 40 $23.00 24,840.00$        No Bid No Bid $25.00 27,000.00$        No Bid No Bid $27.00 $29,160.00 No Bid No Bid
5 30.1"-36" 33 15 $28.50 14,107.50$        No Bid No Bid $29.00 14,355.00$        No Bid No Bid $34.00 $16,830.00 No Bid No Bid
6 36.1"- 41 15 $35.00 21,525.00$        No Bid No Bid $37.00 22,755.00$        No Bid No Bid $38.00 $23,370.00 No Bid No Bid

95,592.50$        -$                        102,220.00$      -$                    113,630.00$      -$                    

No. Grind Type Bid Price Total Bid Price Total Bid Price Total Bid Price Total Bid Price Total Bid Price Total
1 Full Grind $250.00 100,000.00$      No Bid No Bid $350.00 140,000.00$      No Bid No Bid $175.00 70,000.00$        No Bid No Bid

No.
1
2
3
4
5

$26,850.00 -$                        $27,285.00 -$                    -$                    $29,000.00

No. D.B.H Avg 
Dia

Est. # Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class Bid Price Total by class

1 0"-10" 8 1 $11.50 92.00$                No Bid No Bid $4.00 32.00$                No Bid No Bid $14.50 $116.00 No Bid No Bid
2 10.1" - 18" 12 2 $15.50 372.00$             No Bid No Bid $14.00 336.00$             No Bid No Bid $17.00 $408.00 No Bid No Bid
3 18.1"-24" 20 2 $23.50 940.00$             No Bid No Bid $21.00 840.00$             No Bid No Bid $19.00 $760.00 No Bid No Bid
4 24.1"-30" 26 2 $27.00 1,404.00$          No Bid No Bid $25.00 1,300.00$          No Bid No Bid $20.00 $1,040.00 No Bid No Bid
5 30.1"-36" 32 2 $32.50 2,080.00$          No Bid No Bid $29.00 1,856.00$          No Bid No Bid $22.00 $1,408.00 No Bid No Bid
6 36.1"- 36 2 $39.00 2,808.00$          No Bid No Bid $37.00 2,664.00$          No Bid No Bid $22.00 $1,584.00 No Bid No Bid

7,696.00$          -$                        7,028.00$          -$                    5,316.00$          -$                    

THE VILLAGE AND PARK DISTRCIT OF OAK PARK ARE STILL WORKING TO CONFIRM THE QUALIFICATION OF LOW BIDDERS.

Parkway Restoration with Sod $10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Laborer $50.00 $105.00 No Bid $100.00 $125.00

2021 Parkway Restoration Rate per Square Yard

Est. #
400

A & B Tree Service Inc. Davis Tree Care Inc. Homer Tree Service Inc. Sinnott Tree Service Inc. Winkler Tree Inc.Bartlett Tree Service  Inc.

No Bid

$250.00
1 man Log Loader $120.00 $135.00 No Bid $150.00 $175.00

2021 Parkway Tree Stump Removals

1 man Semi Tractor-trailer $120.00 $135.00 No Bid $180.00
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
$250.00

1 man Aerial Lift Truck $120.00 $135.00 No Bid $150.00 $150.00

Total:
2021 Parkway Tree Removal Emergency Call Out Rates Per Hour

2 men Chipper truck w/chipper $180.00 $240.00 No Bid $225.00 $275.00
No Bid

Total:
2021 Summer Parkway Tree Removals

A & B Tree Service Inc. Davis Tree Care Inc. Homer Tree Service Inc. Sinnott Tree Service Inc. Winkler Tree Inc.

2021 Winter Parkway Tree Removals
A & B Tree Service Inc. Davis Tree Care Inc. Homer Tree Service Inc. Sinnott Tree Service Inc. Winkler Tree Inc.

Village of Oak Park
2021 Parkway Tree Cycle Pruning 

Homer Tree Service Inc.Davis Tree Care Inc. Winkler Tree Inc.

$105.00 $125.00

No Bid
No Bid

Est. #
1140
591

1167
347

2 men Chipper truck w/chipper
1 man Aerial Lift Truck

1 man Log Loader

A & B Tree Service Inc. Sinnott Tree Service Inc.

No Bid
No Bid$135.00

Total:

No Bid

Bartlett Tree Service  Inc.

$300.00
$200.00
$500.00
$850.00

$150.00

Bartlett Tree Service  Inc.

Bartlett Tree Service  Inc.

No Bid

2021 Cycle Pruning Emergency Call Out Rates Per Hour
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

$240.00

No Bid
$135.00
$135.00

$275.00
$150.00
$175.00
$250.00

No Bid

2021 Park Tree Cycle Pruning 

$11,220.00 No Bid No Bid

1446
1821

1 man Crane No Bid $850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 man Crane $120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $250.00

$250.00

No Bid
No Bid1 man Semi Tractor-trailer

Laborer No Bid

$12,240.00
$1,785.00
$1,275.00
$765.00

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

Total:

2021 Emergency Call Out Rates Per Hour
2 men Chipper truck w/chipper $180.00 No Bid $240.00 No Bid $225.00 $275.00

1 man Aerial Lift Truck $120.00 No Bid $135.00 No Bid $150.00 $150.00
1 man Log Loader $120.00 No Bid $135.00 No Bid $150.00 $175.00

1 man Semi Tractor-trailer $120.00 No Bid $135.00 No Bid $180.00 $250.00
1 man Crane $120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $250.00 $250.00

Park District of Oak Park

Park
Taylor Park (151 Trees)

Lindberg Park (163 Trees)
Andersen Park (22 Trees)

Dole Center (16 Trees)
Prandolph Park (6 Tree)

A & B Tree Service Inc. Bartlett Tree Service  Inc. Davis Tree Care Inc. Homer Tree Service Inc. Sinnott Tree Service Inc. Winkler Tree Inc.
$11,325.00
$12,225.00
$1,650.00
$1,200.00
$450.00

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$12,960.00
$9,000.00
$2,160.00
$2,880.00
$2,000.00

2021 Alternative Non-Emergency Call Out Rates Per Hour

Total:

Laborer $50.00 No Bid $105.00 No Bid $100.00 $125.00

2021 Park Tree Removals
A & B Tree Service Inc. Bartlett Tree Service  Inc. Davis Tree Care Inc. Homer Tree Service Inc. Sinnott Tree Service Inc. Winkler Tree Inc.

2 men Chipper truck w/chipper $180.00 No Bid $170.00 No Bid $175.00 $275.00
1 man Aerial Lift Truck $120.00 No Bid $100.00 No Bid $125.00 $150.00

1 man Log Loader $120.00 No Bid $100.00 No Bid $100.00 $175.00
1 man Semi Tractor-trailer $120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $150.00 $250.00

1 man Crane $120.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $200.00 l
Laborer $50.00 No Bid $85.00 No Bid $50.00 $125.00
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