
Item Unit
Waste 

Management
LRS Groot

Republic 
Services

*Municipal Trash (96 or 64-gallon container) Cost per Month $19.93 $14.15 No Bid No Bid

Recycling (64-gallon container) Cost per Month included included No Bid No Bid

Household Hazardous Waste and Electronics Program Cost per Month included $1.45 No Bid No Bid

Total Cost per Residential Unit per month Cost per Month $19.93 $15.60 No Bid No Bid

Food Scrap/Yard Waste (96-gallon container) Base Program – Opt-in Cost per Month $20.13 $15.00 No Bid No Bid

Additional Services

*Municipal Trash Sticker Cost per Sticker $1.98 $2.70 No Bid No Bid

Landscape Waste Sticker Cost per Sticker $3.55 $2.70 No Bid No Bid

Back Door Collection Service Cost per Month $22.02 $15.00 No Bid No Bid

Emergency Requests for Public Service Cost per Hour $140.00 $135.00 No Bid No Bid

Base Fall Leaf Collection Program (6-week collection) Cost per Year $252,700.00 $184,000.00 No Bid No Bid

Additional week of Leaf Collection Cost per Week $42,116.00 $36,000.00 No Bid No Bid

Street Sweeper Disposal Cost per Pull $225.00 $200.00 No Bid No Bid

Special Landscape Waste Pickup
Cost per Cubic 

Yard
$25.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid

Alternate Food Scrap/Yard Waste Collection Program

Food Scrap/Yard Waste (35-gallon container) Universal program) 
Cost per unit 
per month

$22.39 $11.00 No Bid No Bid

Alternate Leaf Collection Program No. 1 Pricing

Bagged/Rigid Container Collection Program (6-week Collection Cost per Year $197,900.00 $145,000.00 No Bid No Bid

Additional week of collection Cost per Week $32,983.00 $28,000.00 No Bid No Bid

Alternate Leaf Collection Program No. 2 Pricing

Bagged/Rigid Container Collection Program (6-8 week Collection Cost per Sticker $3.55 $2.70 No Bid No Bid

Additional Rates

*Bulk Item Disposal (two refuse stickers) per item $3.96 $5.40 No Bid No Bid

*White Goods per item $30.00 $5.40 No Bid No Bid

Additional Recycling Cart Rental 
per cart/per 

month
$3.00

no additional 
charge

No Bid No Bid

Additional 96 gallon Carts
per cart or per 

month
$20 per cart

$3.00 per 
month

No Bid No Bid

Contractor Proposals

*disposal cost not included.
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